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Dear ,
 

Thank you for your information request of 14th June 2016.  Aberdeen City Council
(ACC) has completed the necessary search for the information requested.
 
I have repeated your request below for ease of reference.
 
The Press has confirmed that Aberdeen Journals owned by DC Thomson is
negotiating to take on the tenancy of one of the floors in Marischal Square. I
obviously understand that they will be negotiating with Muse / Ryden and that
the exact numbers of the deal will be subject to commercial confidentiality. I also
understand that you may use this fact to tell me that you don't hold third party
information. However, as head tenant and because ACC will have to make up any
potential shortfall should the occupancy rates not meet the terms of the original
agreement between Muse and ACC you must know what the deal between all
MS2 tenants and Muse will be since it's in ACC's interest to know what their
future financial exposure might be on their annual budget.
 
Therefore can you give me an answer to the following questions:
 

1.    a) Has Aberdeen Journals / DC Thomson been offered a rent free period to
persuade them to move into MS2 and

 
We can confirm that, as reported, discussions have taken place with Aberdeen
Journals Limited in relation to the occupation of space within Marischal Square and
that Aberdeen Journals have been offered a rent free period.
 
Aberdeen City Council as Head Tenant are fully aware of the terms discussed - either
with Muse or one of the scheme’s joint marketing agents Ryden and CBRE - for any
occupation of the development.
 

b) If yes, what is the time frame of that rent free period?
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information concerning the conditions of the
proposed lease as we consider this information exempt from disclosure.  In order to
comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
gives notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Section 33(1)(b) - of
the FOISA.
 
Section 33(1)(b) of FOISA 2002 states that information is exempt information if its
disclosure under this Act would, or would be likely to, prejudice substantially the
commercial interests of any person (including, without prejudice to that generality, a
Scottish public authority).
 
This exemption covers information in relation to the proposed rent, other commercial
terms of the lease and other incentives.
 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:



 
The lease specified has not yet been concluded and the release of the information at
this stage would influence the negotiating position of other parties wishing to occupy
space in the development, to the obvious detriment of the Council’s commercial
interests.
 
Furthermore, disclosure of the requested information at this stage is likely to weaken
ACC’s  position in a competitive environment by revealing sensitive information of
potential usefulness to competitors. ACC must maintain good working relationships with
reputable companies to enable it to obtain value for money and so releasing
commercially sensitive information could potentially damage ACC’s reputation with
such third parties, dissuading the third parties from engaging with ACC.
 
ACC recognises that there is a public interest in being open and transparent about its
negotiations with third parties. However,  ACC is of the view that in this case, the public
interest lies in withholding the information as disclosure would prejudice ACC’s
commercial relationships and future contractual negotiations with third parties and after
considering all the circumstances of the case, the public interest is best met by applying
Section 33(1)(b) at this time.
 

2.    Please confirm that the per square footage rental price Aberdeen Journals
will pay is above the ACC / Muse agreed break even price?

 
A lease has not yet been concluded and so no such price has been agreed. 
 
Therefore, ACC is unable to provide you with information on concerning the per square
footage rental price Aberdeen Journals will pay as it is not held by ACC.  In order to
comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
 

3.    Please confirm that ACC will not be financially penalised because of the
deal agreed with Aberdeen Journals?

 
As stated in response to question 2,  a lease has not yet been concluded and as such,
ACC is unable to provide you with information on regarding any financial penalties
ACC may occur as this information is not held.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
 

4.    Please confirm in years the initial length of rental agreed with Aberdeen
Journals?

 
As the specified lease has not yet been concluded, information cannot be considered
for disclosure as it is not held in terms of section 17 (1)(b) of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
 
Nicky Leiper
Information Compliance Officer



 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more
information about your rights under FOISA.
 
 
 
 
Nicky Leiper
Information Compliance Officer
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Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
Room 1-24
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ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call
plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of 10.24p per minute (the
same as 01224s).
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