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Dear 
 
Thank you for your clarified information request of 29 March 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the
necessary search for the information requested.

 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Under the Freedom Of Information Act I would like to know the following –
 
I would also like all of the figures broken down per school with the name of each school within the local authority.
 
I refer to an offensive weapon is any article made or adapted for use for causing injury to the person, or intended by
the person having it with him for such use by him or by some other person.
 
To clarify I was referring to knives.
 
How many pupils at schools under the jurisdiction of Aberdeen City Council have been suspended due to
 

a)       possession of drugs in school in the last 10 years
b)      possession of alcohol in school in the last 10 years
c)       possession of an offensive weapon(s) including a knife or knives in the last 10 years
d)      violent behaviour in the last 10 years

This information is not held in a way that can be easily provided and therefore, ACC is unable to provide you with
information on a breakdown per school, with the name of each school, of the number of pupils who have been
suspended due to a) possession of drugs, b) possession of alcohol, c) possession of an offensive weapon(s) including a
knife or knives, d) violent behaviour in the last 10 years  as the cost of providing it has been calculated as being in excess
of the statutory maximum (£600).
 
To explain this, this level of information is recorded in individual pupil files at each school and not centrally and so staff
would be required to work through all pupil files and record the breakdown figures.  For example, for 1 Primary School, it
would take 1 ACC officer going through 530 pupil files to find the requested information for the past 10 years.  This has
been calculated as taking an average of 5 minutes per file, which equates to 44.2 hours, at the cost of £662,50 in total.  As
there are 48 primary schools in the local authority area, it has been calculated that providing the requested information for
all of these schools would be £662.50 x 48 primary schools, at an approximate total cost of £31,800.
 
With regards to secondary schools, for 1 Secondary School, it would take 1 ACC officer going through 800 pupil files to find
the information requested for the past 10 years.  This has been calculated as taking an average of 10 minutes per file,
which equates to 133 hours, at the cost of £2,000 in total.  As there are 12 secondary schools in the local authority area, it
has been calculated that providing the requested information for all of these schools would be £2,000 x 12 secondary
schools, at an approximate total cost of £24,000.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby give notice that we are
refusing your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of Compliance - of the FOISA.  ACC would be happy to
discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide some information of interest to you within the
maximum cost limits.  Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is
something you would like to pursue.
 
How many pupils at schools under the jurisdiction of Aberdeen City Council have been expelled due to:
 

a)       possession of drugs in school in the last 10 years
b)      possession of alcohol in school in the last 10 years
c)       possession of an offensive weapon(s) including knives in the last 10 years
d)      violent behaviour in the last 10 years

As with the question above, this information is not held in a way that can be easily provided and therefore, ACC is unable
to provide you with information on a breakdown per school, with the name of each school, of the number of pupils who
have been expelled due to a) possession of drugs, b) possession of alcohol, c) possession of an offensive weapon(s)



including a knife or knives, d) violent behaviour in the last 10 years  as the cost of providing it has been calculated as
being in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  The same exercise required for the above question would also have to
be undertaken to provide the information on the number of pupils expelled – please see above for an explanation as to why
providing this information would incur excessive costs.
 
How many pupils at schools under the jurisdiction of Aberdeen City Council have been warned due to
 

a)       possession of drugs in school in the last 10 years
b)      possession of alcohol in school in the last 10 years
c)       possession of an offensive weapon(s) including a knife or knives in the last 10 years
d)      violent behaviour in the last 10 years

This information is not held in a way that can be easily provided and therefore, ACC is unable to provide you with
information on a breakdown per school, with the name of each school, of the number of pupils who have been warned
due to a) possession of drugs, b) possession of alcohol, c) possession of an offensive weapon(s) including a knife or
knives, d) violent behaviour in the last 10 years  as the cost of providing it has been calculated as being in excess of the
statutory maximum (£600).  The same exercise required for the above two questions would also have to be undertaken to
provide the information on the number of pupils warned – please see above for an explanation as to why providing this
information would incur excessive costs.
 
We would like to advise that ACC has published responses to other FOI requests which may be of interest to you.  Please
refer to the online Disclosure Log at the following web links:
 
2016 Disclosure Log:
http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/council government/dp foi/freedom information/DisclosureLog2016/education 2016.asp
 
2015 Disclosure Log:
http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/council_government/dp_foi/freedom_information/DisclosureLog2015/education_2015.asp
 
2014 Disclosure Log:
http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/council_government/dp_foi/freedom_information/disclosurelog2014/education_2014.asp
 
2013 Disclosure Log:
http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/council_government/dp_foi/freedom_information/DisclosureLog2013/education_2013.asp
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
Room 1-24
Town House
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have free minutes  included in your mobile call plan
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10 24p per minute (the same as 01224s)
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