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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 12 February 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
I am emailing under the freedom of information act 2000 to ask for information on abuse
cases in Mosques and Madrassas in your area.
 
Please see below for full details of my request
 
1). How many cases of complaint or allegations relating to physical abuse which took place in
a Mosque or Madrassa for  the following years 2012, 2013,2014, 2015  
In the period requested, ACC received 2,135 allegations or complaints regarding abuse.
However, in order to establish whether any of these allegations or complaints related to the
sexual abuse of a child or children on the premises of a madrassa or mosque, staff would have to
search through all of the files. This information is not retained electronically.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of cases of complaints or
allegations relating to physical abuse which took place in a Mosque or Madrassa for the
following years 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015 as the cost of providing it has been calculated as being
in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  To explain this, it would involve an ACC Officer
manually searching through 2,135 files and extracting the relevant information.  This has been
calculated at 30 minutes per file, which equates to 1,068 hours, at the cost of £16,020 in total.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of
Compliance - of the FOISA.  ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your
request, so we can provide some information of interest to you within the maximum cost limits. 
Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is
something you would like to pursue.
 
2) How many cases of complaint or allegation relating to sexual abuse did you receive which
took place in a Mosque or Madrassa for the following years 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015?
Similarly, ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of cases of complaints
or allegations relating to sexual abuse which took place in a Mosque or Madrassa for the
following years 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015 as the cost of providing it has been calculated as being
in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  Please refer to the excessive cost explanation in
Question 1 above for further details.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of
Compliance - of the FOISA.  ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your
request, so we can provide some information of interest to you within the maximum cost limits. 



Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is
something you would like to pursue.
 
3). How many cases of complaint or allegation relating to emotional abuse did you receive
which took place in a Mosque or Madrassa for the following years 
2012, 2013, 2014, 2015?
Similarly, ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of cases of complaints
or allegations relating to emotional abuse which took place in a Mosque or Madrassa for the
following years 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015 as the cost of providing it has been calculated as being
in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  Please refer to the excessive cost explanation in
Question 1 above for further details.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of
Compliance - of the FOISA.  ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your
request, so we can provide some information of interest to you within the maximum cost limits. 
Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is
something you would like to pursue.
 
4) For each case in questions 1, 2 and 3 what action was taken against the perpetrator in each
case?
5). In each case please say if the allegation or complaint was against an;
adult on a child 16 or under OR mosque/Madrassa student)
adult on adult(over 16 and not a student)
child on child (16 or under or students)
6) If no action was taken for each allegation what was the reason for this?
7) How many of the allegations for each year led to police involvement?
8) How many of the accusations led to police cautions?
9) How many criminal prosecutions were brought about against perpetrators?
10) How many people were convicted in court for the above cases?
11) What was the longest sentence given to a perpetrator for any of the above cases? 
12) How many different institutions did all of the all allegations take place in ie (if 5
allegations took place in one institution please count this as one) 
13) What was the age of the youngest victim(s) and the age of the oldest victim who suffered
abuse?
Please refer to the response to Questions 1, 2 and 3 above.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on for Questions 4-13 as the cost of providing it
has been calculated as being in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  Please refer to the
excessive cost explanation in Question 1 above for further details.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of
Compliance - of the FOISA.  ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your
request, so we can provide some information of interest to you within the maximum cost limits. 
Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is
something you would like to pursue.
 



14) Is it council policy for all Madrassa/Mosque teachers to have child safety protection
training? 
ACC has not been involved in any child protection work with any specific mosque or madrassa.
 
Child Protection training is readily available to all ACC staff working with children.
 
15) How many Mosques and Madrassa's are currently teaching children in your authority?
This information is not recorded by ACC.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of Mosques and Madrassa’s
currently teaching children in Aberdeen City as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply with
its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
First Floor Room 24
Town House
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/522252/523602

Tel 08456 08 09 10
(The only charge for this call
will be your phone company’s access charge).
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