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Thank you for your information request of 7 July 2017. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

1. A list of each council / public pool facility with address and contact details; phone & email
address for either a pool only facility or a pool within a Sports / Leisure, or other, facility.

2. Details of who manages the pools or sports / leisure, or other, facility; either council
directly, a trust, management company or combination.

3. Which centres have public single sex swimming sessions as part of the timetable (inclusive
of normal and summer time table changes).

4. How many hours of single sex swimming sessions per week are provided per gender
(female / male).

5. If only one gender, either female or male, is provided for please supply the data
(supportive evidence) that shows need and the demand over and above a provision for the
opposite gender.

This information is not held by Aberdeen City Council but by Sport Aberdeen. Sport Aberdeen
are a separate body under FOI legislation and can be contacted here:

http://www.sportaberdeen.co.uk/contact-us

ACC is unable to provide you with information on sports facilities as it is not held by ACC. In
order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby
gives notice that this information is not held by it.

We hope this helps with your request.
Yours sincerely,

Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer

INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST

ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
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