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Thank you for your information request of 23 February 2017. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed
the necessary search for the information requested. Please accept our apologies for the delay in responding
to your request.

Please provide me with the following information;

1) Disclose the address of the office that Aberdeen City Council use in Fredrick Street,
Aberdeen?

Frederick Street Business Centre
Aberdeen

Frederick Street

AB24 5HY

2) How many people work in the Frederick Street office?

Receptionists

CS System Analyst

Team Leaders

Customer Service Advisers
Educational Psychologists

Senior Educational Psychologist
Depute Principal Educational Psychologist
Principal Educational Psychologist
Administration Officer

Senior Support Assistant
Community Safety Analyst
Development Officer

Enforcement Officer

Warden Manager

Priorities Families Staff Members
Priorities Families Manager

City Warden Officer

City Warden Development Officer
Service Manager
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Violence against Women Coordinator
Violence against Women Office

Asbit Staff

Asbit — Manager

Analyst

Community Safety Development Officer
Community Safety Manager

Admin Officer

Blue Badge Enforcement Officer
Safety Aberdeen Enforcement Officer
Safety Aberdeen Manager
Anti-Social Behaviour Manager

Early Years Team total

Reception Team

Family Learning total

Activity Agreement total

Childcare Services
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ACC shares this building with other organisations including Police Scotland, The Scottish Fire and Rescue

Service, NHS Grampian, CLICC and Aberlour Childcare Services. As such, we recommend that you contact

these organisations in order to establish the exact number of employees these organisations have based at
Frederick Business Centre and job titles for these employees.

Therefore, ACC is unable to provide you with all of the requested information as it is not held by ACC. In
order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice
that this information is not held by it.

3) Define their roles, departments and job titles?
Please see response to question 2.

4) Confirm if the building is leased or owned?
Owned.

5) Confirm if the new build Marishal Square is planned for completion?
Yes.

6) Confirm the name of the contractor and sub-contractor as registered at Company House?
Morgan Sindall is the main contractor.

MORGAN SINDALL CONSTRUCTION & INFRASTRUCTURE LTD.

A variety of sub-contractors will be appointed on the site which will vary from time to time however, full
details of all sub-contractors is held by the main contractor and as such, ACC is unable to provide you with

this information as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17

of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

We hope this helps with your request.

Yours sincerely,

Information Compliance Team



INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST

ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.

Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council

Room 1-24

Town House

Broad Street

ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk

01224 523827/523602
Tel 03000 200 292

*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of 10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).
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