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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 22 February 2017.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.
 

I am writing to you to request information that I believe you hold under the Freedom of
Information Act (FOI):

1)      How many 2, 3 and 4 year olds eligible for funded childcare are living in the local
authority area.
 

       a) eligible 2 year olds - 400

       b) eligible 3 year olds - 2,462

c) eligible 4 year olds - 2,429

       2) How many are (please provide separately for each age group)

i)    Living in the local authority area -  See response to Q1.

 

ii)   Accessing funded childcare in the local authority area;

 

2yo -   98

               3yo -   1,985

4yo -   2,246

 

iii)  Provided with the funded childcare at partnership nurseries;

 

2yo -  15

3yo -  593

4yo -  526

 

iv)   Provided with the funded childcare at council run nurseries;

 

2yo -  83

3yo -  1,392



4yo -  1,720

 

v)    On waiting lists for funded nursery places; 

 

              103 children without a nursery place are on waiting lists.  This is
because the most local provision is full.

 

vi)   Registered at;.

 

              a) 0 providers,

              b) 1 providers,

               c) 2 providers,

 d) 3 providers,

               e) 4+ providers 

 

We do not provide funded places for a child at more than one EL&C
centre.

 

We do not hold registers for children on waiting lists at partner provider centres and as
such, ACC is unable to provide you with this information as it is not held by ACC.  In
order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 

 

 

We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
 
Nicky Leiper
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
 



 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
3rd Floor North
Business Hub 17
Marischal College
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).
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