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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 22 November 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
The questions in this FOI request all refer to last winter's floods (ie - Storms Desmond, Eva
etc), not previous floods or the current flooding.
 
1) How many people are known to still be unable to return to their homes due to damage
caused by last winter's floods?
As far as the Aberdeen City Council Flood Team are aware there are no people still displaced due
to the Flooding at Christmas 2015-16
 
2) How many households are known to still be unable to return to their homes due to the
damage caused by last winter's floods?
As far as the Aberdeen City Council Flood Team are aware there are no households who are
unable to return to their property due to the Flooding at Christmas 2015-16.
 
3) How many people/households/businesses (please break down the figures) are still
receiving council tax rebates because they are unable to return to their homes/businesses
following last winter's floods. (Local authorities can use powers under Section 13A of the
Local Government Finance Act 1992 to grant council tax discounts on properties affected by
flooding.)
Not applicable, please see our response to Q1 and Q2 above.
 
4) How much council tax money in total has been rebated to people/households/businesses
affected by last winter's floods? (please breakdown and also give an overall total)
 

Altered and Repaired Awards - Flooding

Start Date of Award End Date of Award Value

31/08/2015 07/02/2016 £        560.25
30/12/2015 30/12/2016 £    4,145.94
30/12/2015 21/07/2016 £    1,536.27
04/01/2016 20/07/2016 £    1,292.38
27/01/2016 01/08/2016 £        845.57
08/02/2016 03/08/2016 £        978.52
07/01/2016 07/01/2017 £    2,489.62
30/12/2015 30/12/2016 £    2,533.64
30/12/2015 30/12/2016 £    2,583.11
11/01/2016 11/01/2017 £    2,170.55
07/01/2016 26/06/2016 £        603.57



20/06/2016 20/06/2017 £    1,865.79
Total £  21,605.21

 
5) How much money has been paid out under the Communities and Business Recovery
Scheme in relation to last winter's floods?
Information not held.
 
The Equivalent scheme that was run by Scottish Government was this
http://news.gov.scot/news/financial-help-for-flooded-communities. ACC paid £75,000
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on How much money has been paid out under
the Communities and Business Recovery Scheme in relation to last winter's floods as it is not
held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation
10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not
held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public
interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this
information and considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the
exception.
 
6) Please provide a breakdown of the money paid out under the Communities and Business
Recovery Scheme for people/households/businesses in relation to last winter's floods.
Information not held.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on a breakdown of the money paid out under
the Communities and Business Recovery Scheme for people/households/businesses in
relation to last winter's floods. as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b)
of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in
maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you. 
ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no
information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
7) How many businesses have received business rate relief due to last winter's floods? How
much relief has there been in total due to last winter's floods and how many are still
receiving it?
5 businesses were awarded business rates flood relief (100% for the period affected).
£89,177.95 was awarded in rates relief, there are no businesses still receiving relief due to
flooding.
 
8) How many households have requested Household Flood and Resilience Grants following
last winter's floods? How many requests have been paid out? How much has been paid out
in total on these grants in total in relation to last winter's floods?
Information not held.
 
The Equivalent scheme that was run by Scottish Government was this
http://news.gov.scot/news/financial-help-for-flooded-communities.  Applied for the grant – 58.



Grants Paid – 50. Please see Q5 above for total paid out.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on How many households have requested
Household Flood and Resilience Grants following last winter's floods? How many requests
have been paid out? How much has been paid out in total on these grants in total in relation
to last winter's floods? as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations
under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives
notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs
to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining
this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.
 
9) How many households have been in receipt of Repair and Renew grants in response to last
winter's floods? How much has been paid out under threse grants in relation to last winter's
floods?
Information not held.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on How many households have been in receipt
of Repair and Renew grants in response to last winter's floods? How much has been paid out
under threse grants in relation to last winter's floods? as it is not held by the Council.  In order
to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of
the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by
Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the
public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this
information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as
there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
10) How much in total has been paid out by the council in support for
people/households/businesses affected by last winter's floods. Please provide a breakdown
for each category and provide a total.
Business Compensation Grants -              £15,000
Flooding Support Grant (Business) -        £3,000
Flooding Support Grant (Residential) -   £75,000
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information



(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
Room 1-24
Town House
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 




