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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 1 August 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
I am writing to make a request for information under the Environmental Information
(Scotland) Regulations 2004. This request relates to the use in Scotland of ‘mosquito devices,’
electronic devices that emit high frequency sounds to deter children and young people.
Please send me:
 
1. The number of mosquito or similar devices that are currently in use (or have been in use
by calendar year since 01/01/2008 to 31/12/2015 including an additional shorter calendar
year from 01/01/16 to the present) in premises owned, managed or leased by the Council. If
possible, please disaggregate this data by the year in use (by calendar year as above) and the
type of premises (e.g. sports facilities, libraries, arts centres etc) in which the device is or was
used. Please can the data be provided in a csv file.
ACC do not hold any records on mosquito or similar devices that are currently in use.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The number of mosquito or similar devices
that are currently in use (or have been in use by calendar year since 01/01/2008 to
31/12/2015 including an additional shorter calendar year from 01/01/16 to the present) in
premises owned, managed or leased by the Council as it is not held by the Council.  In order to
comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of
the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by
Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the
public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this
information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as
there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
2. Information held by the Council on the number of mosquito or similar devices that are
currently in use (or have been in use by calendar year since 01/01/2008 to 31/12/2015
including an additional shorter calendar year from 01/01/16 to the present) by private
companies or individuals within the Local Authority area. If possible, please disaggregate this
data by the year in use (by calendar year as above) and by private and individual. Please can
the data be provided in a csv file.
ACC do not hold any records on mosquito or similar devices that are currently in use.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The number of mosquito or similar devices
that are currently in use (or have been in use by calendar year since 01/01/2008 to
31/12/2015 including an additional shorter calendar year from 01/01/16 to the present) in
premises owned, managed or leased by the Council as it is not held by the Council.  In order to
comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of
the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by



Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the
public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this
information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as
there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
3. Information held by the Council regarding the use of such devices, including any Council
policies, procedures, guidelines and reports on their use, in particular information held on
their compatibility or incompatibility with Human Rights legislation. Where possible, please
supply copies of these documents.
ACC do not hold any council policies, procedures, guidelines or reports on the use of these
devices and the compatibility of them with Human Rights legislations.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on Information held by the Council regarding
the use of such devices, including any Council policies, procedures, guidelines and reports on
their use, in particular information held on their compatibility or incompatibility with Human
Rights legislation as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under
the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice
that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to
inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.
 
4. Information on the number of complaints received and responses made, disaggregated by
calendar year from 01/01/2008 to 31/12/2015, including an additional shorter calendar year
from 01/01/16 to the present. If possible, please also disaggregate the data by nature of the
complaint (summary/description of complaint e.g. noise pollution, health concerns) and how
many complaints affected children and young people. Please can the data be provided in a
csv file.
Such complaints would not be specifically categorized and so it would be difficult to search our
records. Each complaint in the time period would have to be accessed and checked to identify if
it related to mosquito or similar devices noise. Between 1 January 2008 and 9 August 2016 there
were 3794 noise related complaints received by ACC. It will take about 2 minutes to access each
complaint and determine if it was relevant to this information request. It would therefore take
approximately 126 hours for an officer to carry out this task. There are no dedicated officers
available to carry out such tasks and, as such, this would have an impact on the Services ability to
provide adequate service, many of which are statutory duties.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on Information on the number of complaints
received and responses made, disaggregated by calendar year from 01/01/2008 to
31/12/2015, including an additional shorter calendar year from 01/01/16 to the present. as it
is excepted from disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing your request under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(b) – Manifestly Unreasonable - of the EIRs.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide
some information of interest to you within the maximum cost limits. Please do contact the
Information Compliance team, who will be happy to advise you, if this is something you would



like to pursue.
 
Our Environmental Health service are aware of 1 complaint received on 20 February 2015
related to noise from mosquito type device used. This was domestic use and did not involve
children/young people.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
Room 1-24
Town House
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).
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