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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 3 February 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the
necessary search for the information requested.

 
I am writing to you to obtain information about how much the council has spent on clear-up operations
following floods this winter. To make my request more specific, I am asking:
 
i) For a total amount spent by the council on clear-up operations following the floods in December and
January - by this I mean the amount spent on repairing flood defences and emergency operations before,
during and after the floods.
ACC currently do not hold a separate figure for spending on flooding alone. The amount spent out of the
budget for all winter maintenance and emergency responses is £100,868.48 so far.
 
However, this is not the final costs to date as Aberdeen City Council will still have ongoing costs and final
invoices to come in.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on a total amount spent by the council on clear-up operations
following the floods in December and January as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives
notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you
as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the
public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and
considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
ii) For this amount, please break it down by the nature of the spending (reasons such as the ones indicated
above) where possible.
All amounts are currently broken down by materials, plant and labour, rather than separate items/areas. These
breakdowns are as follows:
 
Materials: £15,205.54
Plant: £11,798.93
Labour: £73,864.01
 
iii) The original amount the council had set aside in the budget to deal with events such as this.
ACC had set aside a budget of £1,997,000 to cover all Winter Maintenance and Emergency responses for
incidents such as flooding.
 
Please note that ACC made reference to flooding and provision in the budget approved by Full Council on 25
February 2016.  Please refer to Section 5.46 on Page 15 of the budget papers available on ACC’s website at:
http://committees.aberdeencity.gov.uk/documents/s54440/General%20Fund%20Revenue%20Budget%202016-
17%20and%20Non-Housing%20Capital%20Programme%202016-17%20to%202020-21.pdf
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 



INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under Regulation 2(1) of the
Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC considered that it was exempt from
release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice that we are refusing  your request under Section
39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access
the information which you have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your
request. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
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