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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 11 January 2016.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.
 
1. How many households have been assessed as being in fuel poverty in each year since
2010/11?
Please note that ACC only started collecting fuel poverty statistics in the last quarter of 2013-
2014, therefore ACC is unable to break down the requests for support for a specific measure for
anything before 01/04/2014.  As a result, these figures could not be included as ACC cannot
report on this.
 
Please break this down by:
 
a. Council households
2010/2011: not held, please see above
2011/2012: not held, please see above
2012/2013: not held, please see above
2013/2014 not held, please see above
2014/2015: 129
 
b. Any other type of households within the council area (privately rented, privately owned,
etc.)
2010/2011: not held, please see above
2011/2012: not held, please see above
2012/2013: not held, please see above
2013/2014: not held, please see above
2014/2015: 118 (85 = Owner Occupied, 14 = Privately Rented, 19 = Housing Association).
 
So far in 2015/2016, the total for the number of council households is 89. Any other type of
households: 58.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of households which have been
assessed as being in fuel poverty in each year from 2010/2011 to 2013/2014, broken down
by Council households and any other type of households within the council area as it is not
held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation
10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not
held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public
interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this
information and considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the
exception.
 



2. How many households have made a request for assistance with payments towards their
fuel and heating bills in each year since 2010/11? Please break this down by
 
a. Council households
2010/2011: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2011/2012: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2012/2013: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2013/2014: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2014/2015: 160
 
b. Any other type of households within the council area (privately rented, privately owned,
etc.)
2010/2011: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2011/2012: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2012/2013: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2013/2014: not held, please see Question 1 above.
2014/2015: 123 (80 = Owner Occupied, 15 = Privately Rented, 28 = Housing Association).
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the number of households which have made
a request for assistance with payments towards their fuel and heating bills in each year from
2010/2011 to 2013/2014, broken down by Council households and any other type of
households within the council area as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b)
of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in
maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you. 
ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no
information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
3. What are the 5 main reasons that a household makes a request for such assistance?
ACC cannot currently report on this – the Service currently captures the general reason why a
householder will contact ACC but not the specific reason behind that in a way which can be
extracted from ACC’s database.
 
However, in general the 5 most common reasons for a householder to contact ACC are:
 
1: For general advice: do not specifically have an issue but wanted to know if there was anything
they could do.
2: Fuel Supplier Issue: could be that they are wanting to change supplier or have moved home
and do not know how to set up their accounts.
3: Grants and Offers: the householder has heard that there is potentially something available
and want to check if they are eligible.
4: Heating Demos: the householder would like help to set up and use their heating controls
effectively.
5: Insulation: the householder would like to know if they need additional insulation/ which types
of insulation are available and how to get it.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the 5 main reasons that a household makes a



request for such assistance as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b)
of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in
maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you. 
ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no
information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
4. What type of assistance is provided to households by the council for heating and fuel
costs?
ACC funds the Home Energy Advice Team (HEAT) through Scarf (http://www.scarf.org.uk/) to
offer practical help and support with dealing with householders’ fuel bills.  The HEAT team can
deal with suppliers to ensure that the householder is on the best possible tariff for their
situation and help switch supplier if one is identified as being cheaper.  Fuel debt can also be
reduced as part of the negotiations with suppliers on repayment plans.  Applying to tariff
support payments such as Warm Home Discount is also offered. 
 
5. How much money has the council spent towards financial assistance with fuel and heating
bills for households within the council area in each year since 2010/11? Please break this
down by
a. Council households
b. Any other type of households within the council area (privately rented, privately owned,
etc.)
There has been no direct financial assistance to households.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
First Floor Room 24
Town House



Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/522252/523602

Tel 08456 08 09 10
(The only charge for this call
will be your phone company’s access charge).

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 




