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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 27 March 2017.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act can I ask for the following information covering 2014,
2015, 2016 and 2017 (to date);
 

1)      How many schools your Authority is responsible for?
 
65
 

2)      How many contain asbestos?
 
51

 
3)      The names of the schools that contain chrysotile?

 
Abbotswells Primary
Aberdeen Grammar School
Ashley Road School
Bramble Brae School
Bridge of Don Academy
Broomhill School
Bucksburn School (currently
closed)
Charleston School
Cordyce Residential School
Cornhill School
Culter School
Cults School
Danestone School
Dyce Academy
Dyce Primary
Fernielea School
Ferryhill School
Forehill School
Gilcomstoun School
Glashieburn School
Greenbrae School
Hanover Street School
Harlaw Academy
Hazelhead Academy



Hazelwood School
Holy Family RC School
Kincorth Academy
Kingsford School
Kingswells School
Kirkhill School
Kittybrewster School
Loriston School
Middleton Park School
Milltimber School
Muirfield School
Northfield Academy
Oldmachar Academy
Quarryhill School
Riverbank School
Scotstown School
Skene Square School
St Josephs RC School
St Machar Academy
St Peters RC School
Stoneywood School
Sunnybank School
Torry Academy
Tullos School
Walker Road School
Westpark School
Woodside School

 
4)      The names of the schools that contain amosite?

 
·     Ashley Road School
·     Bramble Brae School
·     Bridge of Don Academy
·     Bucksburn School (currently closed)
·      Cordyce Residential School
·      Cornhill School
·      Cults School

Dyce Primary
Fernielea School
Ferryhill School
Greenbrae School

·          Harlaw Academy
·          Hazelhead Academy

Kirkhill School  
Kittybrewster School  
Milltimber School  
Muirfield School  
Northfield Academy  



Quarryhill School  
Riverbank School  
Skene Square School  
St Josephs RC School  
St Machar Academy  

·       Stoneywood School
Torry Academy
Tullos School

·       Westpark School
 

5)      The names of the schools that contain crocidolite?
 
·        Broomhill School
·        Kittybrewster School
·        Skene Square School
·        Walker Road School

 
6)      How many system built schools your Authority is responsible for? 

 
ACC is unable to provide you with this information as it is not held by the Council.  In order
to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held
- of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required
by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the
case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in
disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and
considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.

 
7)      The names of the schools that are system built, including: -

a)      What type of system building are they?
b)     What mark are they?
c)      When were they constructed?

 
I would prefer this data broken down by year please.
 
None.
 
In the date range listed for the request, 2014 to 2017, only Brimmond School has been
constructed, this building was not a system built construction.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.



Yours sincerely,
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
3rd Floor North
Business Hub 17
Marischal College
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of 10.24p per minute (the same as
01224s).

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 
 
 
 
 




