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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 21 March 2017.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.
 
This is an EIR request for electronic copies of all documentation which you have including
correspondence or other documentation showing;
 

1)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Northburn of the Rubislaw otherwise
known as the Denburn which, occurred on or about 26 October 2009 in the area of
21/25 Forest Road, Aberdeen.
 

No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
2)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Denburn which occurred on or about 26

October 2009 in the area of Carden Place, Albert Lane and Queens Cross, Aberdeen.
 

No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
3)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Denburn which occurred on or about

the 26 October 2009 in the area if Desswood Place, Beaconsfield Place, Queens Lane
North and Fountainhall Road, Aberdeen.

 
No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
4)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Denburn which occurred on or about 1

or 2 November 2009 in the area of 21/25 Forest Road, Aberdeen
 

No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that



this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
5)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Denburn which occurred on or about 1

or 2 November 2009 in the area of Carden Place, Albert Lane and Queens Cross,
Aberdeen

 
No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
6)     The nature and extent of any flooding of the Denburn which occurred on or about 1

or 2 November 2009 in the area of Desswood Place, Beaconsfield Place, Queens
Lane North and Fountainhall Road, Aberdeen.

 
No records found aligning specifically to these dates. ACC is unable to provide you with this
information as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform
you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this
exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied
that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information held, the
public interest lies with the exception.

 
7)     The response by the council to the flooding on 26 October and again on 1 or 2

November 2009 in all of the above areas.
 

Please See appendix B attached. Third party names and personal details, as well as the
names of ACC Officers who are below Head of Service level have been redacted (blacked out)
from the attached correspondence. This is because ACC considers that this information is
exempted from disclosure.

 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC
hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Regulation 11(2) in
conjunction with Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information – of the EIRs.

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as the
information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, and the applicant is
not the data subject.

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as ACC considers that disclosure of
this information would be a breach of the first Data Protection Principle (that personal
information must be processed fairly and lawfully). Third parties named within the attached
document and ACC Officers below Head of Service level would not expect ACC to release this
information about them into the public domain under the EIRs (or the Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002.

 
8)     The dates, nature and extent of any subsequent incidents of flooding of the Denburn

in the area of 21/25 Forest Road, Aberdeen which occurred after the incident on 1 or
2 November.
 



From GIS:
 

Flooding Incidents
Flood No:191
Date (to transfer): 2007 - 09
Date: Null
Street Name: Carden Place
Building No/Name
Flood No:  191
Flood Type/Cause:  Fluvial
Ownership of Incident:  Null
Any other Comments:  Flooding to several commercial properties. Private screen from 21
Forest Road collapsed into North Burn of Rubislaw. Blockage resulted.
Action Taken
Further Action Required: N
Details of Further Action
Status
Watercourse Source/Catchment: Null
Documents/Photographs:  Null

 
Please also see Appendix A.

 
9)     The dates, nature and extent of any subsequent incidents of flooding of the Denburn

in the area Carden Place, Albert Lane and Queens Cross, Aberdeen which occurred
after the incident on 1 or 2 November 2009.
 

From GIS:
 

Flooding Incidents
Flood No:225
Date (to transfer):  Null
Date:          25/08/2012
Street Name: Carden Place
Building No/Name: 70
Flood No:  225
Flood Type/Cause:  Fluvial/Pluvial
Ownership of Incident: Property Owner
Any other Comments: Flooding in Dizzy's car park due to water arising from private lane
behind Beaconsfield Place. Combination of Denburn overtopping and pluvial flooding
Action Taken: Survey carried out on 29/08/2012. Wall constructed by ACC along section of
private lane where burn overtopped
Further Action Required:  Y
Details of Further Action: Owners of Dizzy's have consulted Fairhurst with a view to
implementing a new drainage system in car park
Status: Ongoing
Watercourse Source/Catchment:  Denburn
Documents/Photographs: \\Malin\bridges and structures\Flooding\Reports of

Flooding\Fountainhall Road - Albert Lane
 

Please also see Appendix A
 

10)  The dates, nature and extent of any subsequent incidents of flooding of the Denburn
in the area of Desswood Place, Beaconsfield Place, Queens Lane North and
Fountainhall Road, Aberdeen which occurred after the incident on 1 or 2 November
2009.
 

Flooding Incidents
Flood No:342
Date (to transfer): Null
Date: 23/12/2012
Street Name: Fountainhall



Building No/Name: Null
Flood No: 342
Flood Type/Cause: Null
Ownership of Incident: Null
Any other Comments: Flooding to businesses along Albert Lane - from Denburn and Surface
Water. Meeting with SW on 10 Jan - further survey and in work required by ACC and SW
Action Taken: Meeting with Cala re possible work on Beaconsfield lane on 21 Jan. Removing
trees/vegetation along embankment to allow for a sandbag flood barrier to be built along private
lane.
Further Action Required: Y
Details of Further Action: Null
Status:       Ongoing
Watercourse Source/Catchment: Hol Burn
Documents/Photographs: \\m\lin\bridges and structures\Flooding\Reports of

Flooding\Fountainhall Road - Albert Lane
 

Please also see Appendix A
 

11)  The response by the council to any subsequent flooding events
 

Please see Appendix B
 

12)  The terms of any assessment of the Denburn which was undertaken by Aberdeen
City Council  in accordance with Section 18 of the Flood Risk Management
(Scotland) Act 2009 – which requires local authorities to assess bodies of water to
ascertain whether the condition of any such bodies of water gives rise to a risk of
flooding land.

 
N/A

 
13)  The terms of any flood alleviation scheme established in relation to the Denburn area

of 21/25 Forest Road, Aberdeen.
 

N/A
 

14)  The terms of any flood alleviation scheme established in relation to the Denburn area
of Carden Place, Albert Lane and Queens Cross, Aberdeen.

 
N/A

 
15)  The terms of any flood alleviation scheme established in relation to the Denburn area

of Desswood Place, Beaconsfield Place, Queens Lane North and Fountainhall Road,
Aberdeen.

 
N/A

 
16)  The terms of any numerical modelling of the Denburn carried out on behalf of

Aberdeen City Council to establish the likely flow rates within the Denburn.
 

The calculation of flows using ReFH2 methodology (with parameters from FEH 13) has recently
been undertaken for the Den Burn at Maidencraig, in accordance with national guidelines.  The
200 year peak flow at the upstream end of the site was estimated as having a peak flow of
4.61 m3/s, which increased to 8.97 m3/s at the downstream boundary of the site due to
additional flows from a tributary watercourse.

 
Third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC Officers who are below
Head of Service level have been redacted (blacked out) from the attached correspondence.
This is because ACC considers that this information is exempted from disclosure.

 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC
hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of Regulation 11(2) in



conjunction with Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information – of the EIRs.
 

In making this decision ACC considered the following points:
 

ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as the
information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, and the applicant is
not the data subject.

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as ACC considers that disclosure of
this information would be a breach of the first Data Protection Principle (that personal
information must be processed fairly and lawfully). Third parties named within the attached
document and ACC Officers below Head of Service level would not expect ACC to release this
information about them into the public domain under the EIRs (or the Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002.

 
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
 
 
Yours sincerely,
 
 
Information Compliance Team
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under Regulation
2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC considered that
it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice that we are
refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you have requested
under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request. Please refer to the
attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
 
Information Compliance Team
Communications and Promotion
Office of Chief Executive
Aberdeen City Council
Room 1-24
Town House
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk

01224 523827/523602

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of 10.24p per minute (the same as
01224s).

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 
 
 
 



 

































































 

 



 

 

 




