
 
 
From: Foi Enquiries  
Sent: 17 December 2019 14:49 
 
Subject: EIR-19-1605 - Highways 
 
 
Thank you for your information request of 26 November 2019.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has 
completed the necessary search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below. 
 
Highway Bond Provision  
1.Please could you confirm what are the individual elements that your Authority includeswithin 
their bond requirement for all highways work for S278 and S38 agreements? 
2.Please could you provide an average value for bond provision for S278 and S38agreements? 
3.Please confirm what items of highway apparatus currently attract commuted sums, andwhat are 
the individual costs? 
4.Would you consider using the developer obtained tender value for calculating the bondprovision 
for S278 and S38 agreements? 
5.Please could you confirm your inspection fee or percentage applicable relevant to thebond 
provision for S278 and S38 agreements? 
 
Highway S38/S278 Timescale  
Section S278 Agreements relating to residential developments during each of the past 5 financial 
years.  
1. Please could you confirm the average time taken from technical submission to the issue of a 
technical approval?  
2. Please could you confirm what is the average time from technical approval to the completion of 
a Section 278 legal agreement? i.e. legal engrossment?  
3. Please could you confirm the average time to grant a Streetworks Permit, post execution of the 
document in question 2?  
4. What in your opinion is an appropriate timescale for the submission and financial execution of a 
S38/ 278 Agreement?  
5. What improvements do you think could be made to the overall process from submission to 
engrossment?  
6. Section 38 Road Adoptions relating to residential developments during each of the past 5 
financial years.  

a. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken:  
b. from technical submission to technical approval to;  
c. completion of a Section 38 legal agreement to;  
d. commencement of the maintenance period to;  
e. the date of formal adoption to;  
f. notification that any bond can be cancelled. 

 
Please note that Sections S278 and S38 appear to relate to the Highways Act 1980 which only applies 
in England and Wales.  With this in mind, as we are a local authority in Scotland, we hold no records 
or information. 
 
We are unable to provide you with information on all above questions as it is not held by the 
Council.  In order to comply with our obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - 
Information Not Held - of the EIRs, we hereby gives notice that this information is not held by 



us.  We are required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the 
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public 
interest in disclosing this information to you.  We are satisfied that we do not hold this information 
and consider that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception. 
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST 
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under Regulation 
2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), we considered that it 
was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice that we are 
refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you have requested 
under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which we have handled your request. Please refer to the 
attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs. 
 
We hope this helps with your request.  
 
Yours sincerely, 
 

 

Salomeh Kheyri Rad | Access to Information Officer 
Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback 
|Customer 
Marischal College | Business Hub 6 | 1st Floor  | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 
1AB 
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