
From: Foi Enquiries  
Sent: 16 December 2019 12:54 
 
Subject: EIR-19-1384 - Market Stance  
 
Thank you for your information request of 15 October 2019.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has 
completed the necessary search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below. 
 
Please note that the attachments are available by emailing foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk  
 
 
Documents from Aberdeen City Council for a period of 24 months prior to the accident– 
Clarification received: The accident occurred on 20 January 2018. 
 

(i) Records of inspection for the road/footway at Market Stance, Aberdeen.  
Please find enclosed the inspection records under ‘condition survey’. 
 
Please note that third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC 
Officers who are below Chief Officer level have been redacted from the attached 
documents. This is because ACC considers that this information is excepted from 
disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of 
the EIRs, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of 
Regulation 11(2) in conjunction with 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information - of the EIRs. 

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as 
the information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, of 
which the applicant is not the data subject.  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as we consider that disclosure of 
this information would be a breach of the ‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ 
principle. These individuals have not consented to the disclosure of this information and 
ACC does not consider that they would expect ACC to release this information about 
them into the public domain under the FOISA. 
 

(ii) Maintenance records including records of independent contractors working in Market 
Stance, Aberdeen.  
Please find enclosed the maintenance records under ‘maintenance management’.  
 
Please note that third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC 
Officers who are below Chief Officer level have been redacted from the attached 
documents. This is because ACC considers that this information is excepted from 
disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of 
the EIRs, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of 
Regulation 11(2) in conjunction with 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information - of the EIRs. 

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:  
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ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as 
the information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, of 
which the applicant is not the data subject.  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as we consider that disclosure of 
this information would be a breach of the ‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ 
principle. These individuals have not consented to the disclosure of this information and 
ACC does not consider that they would expect ACC to release this information about 
them into the public domain under the FOISA. 
 
Please note that ACC do not hold records of maintenance records of independent 
contractors.  
 
We are unable to provide you with information on maintenance records of independent 
contractors working in Market Stance, Aberdeen as it is not held by the Council.  In 
order to comply with our obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - 
Information Not Held - of the EIRs, we hereby gives notice that this information is not 
held by us.  We are required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why 
in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception 
outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  We are satisfied that 
we do not hold this information and consider that, as there is no information held, the 
public interest lies with the exception. 
 

(iii) Statement of the Roads Authority’s policy under the Code of Practice for Highway 
Maintenance Management (2005) or alternatively records of the Minutes of Highway 
Authority or Local Authority meetings where maintenance or repair policy has been 
discussed or decided.  
Please see the link below to the Road Safety Inspection Manual which has been in use 
since June 2018: 
https://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/sites/default/files/2019-
02/Road%20Safety%20Inspection%20Manual%202018%20V1%20Final_0.pdf 
 
As the Roads Authority’s policy under the Code of Practice for Highway Maintenance 
Management (2005) is otherwise accessible through the above link on our website, it is 
exempt from disclosure.  In order to comply with our obligations under the terms of 
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, we hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under 
the terms of Regulation 6(1)(b)  - Information Already Publicly Available - of the EIRs. 
 
Please find enclosed the previous manual which was in use from April 2012 until June 
2018. 
 
Please note that third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC 
Officers who are below Chief Officer level have been redacted from the attached 
documents. This is because ACC considers that this information is excepted from 
disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of 
the EIRs, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of 
Regulation 11(2) in conjunction with 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information - of the EIRs. 

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:  

 

https://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/sites/default/files/2019-02/Road%20Safety%20Inspection%20Manual%202018%20V1%20Final_0.pdf
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ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as 
the information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, of 
which the applicant is not the data subject.  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as we consider that disclosure of 
this information would be a breach of the ‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ 
principle. These individuals have not consented to the disclosure of this information and 
ACC does not consider that they would expect ACC to release this information about 
them into the public domain under the FOISA. 
 

(iv) Records of complaints about the state of roads/footway at Market Stance for a 24 
month period prior to the accident.  
We did not receive any complaints regarding the state of roads/footways at Market 

Stance in this time period.  
 

We follow the Scottish Local Authority Complaints Handling Procedure. Under this 
procedure, a ‘complaint’ is defined as “an expression of dissatisfaction regarding our 
actions, or lack of action, or the standard of service provided by us or on our behalf”. 
There are some topics that cannot be considered as a ‘complaint’, such as first-time 
requests for a service including the reporting of potholes.  

 
For more information please visit www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/complaints and refer to the 

‘What is a complaint?’ section.   
 

(v) Records of other accidents which have occurred on the stretch of road/footway at 
Market Stance within 24 months of the accident.  
Please find enclosed the records of other accidents under ‘customer services’, ACC have 
received 3 Insurance Claims or intimations for Insurance Claims for this location in the 
given timescale. 
 
Please note that third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC 
Officers who are below Chief Officer level have been redacted from the attached 
documents. This is because ACC considers that this information is excepted from 
disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of 
the EIRs, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of 
Regulation 11(2) in conjunction with 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information - of the EIRs. 

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as 
the information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, of 
which the applicant is not the data subject.  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as we consider that disclosure of 
this information would be a breach of the ‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ 
principle. These individuals have not consented to the disclosure of this information and 
ACC does not consider that they would expect ACC to release this information about 
them into the public domain under the FOISA. 
 

(vi) Date stamp/electronic audit trail showing the date each record of inspection was 
created.  

http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/complaints


This is included in the ‘condition survey’ reports. 
 
Please note that third party names and personal details, as well as the names of ACC 
Officers who are below Chief Officer level have been redacted from the attached 
documents. This is because ACC considers that this information is excepted from 
disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of 
the EIRs, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing your request under the terms of 
Regulation 11(2) in conjunction with 11(3)(a)(i) – Personal Information - of the EIRs. 

 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(2) applies to the information specified above as 
the information in question is personal information relating to living individuals, of 
which the applicant is not the data subject.  

 
ACC is of the opinion that Regulation 11(3)(a)(i) applies, as we consider that disclosure of 
this information would be a breach of the ‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ 
principle. These individuals have not consented to the disclosure of this information and 
ACC does not consider that they would expect ACC to release this information about 
them into the public domain under the FOISA. 
 

(vii) Records showing any complaint(s) or defect(s) in the area of Market Stance, Aberdeen, 
which were forwarded on to or shared with Grampian Housing Association. 
As explained in our response to question iv, we did not receive any complaints regarding 
the state of roads/footways at Market Stance. Also, no information was shared with 
Grampian Housing Association by the Customer Feedback Team who process the 
complaints corporately. 

INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST 
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under Regulation 
2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), we considered that it 
was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice that we are 
refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you have requested 
under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which we have handled your request. Please refer to the 
attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs. 
 
We hope this helps with your request.  
 
Yours sincerely, 
 

 

Access to Information Team 
Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback 
|Customer 
Marischal College | Business Hub 6 | 1st Floor  | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 
1AB 
 
Dial: 01224 522166 
www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC 

 
 

http://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/


 


