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Dear ,
 
Thank you for your information request of 28 June 2019.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed
below.
 
1. The details of all dangerous building notices served within the council area since 2013.

Please include the date issued, the date completed, whether the work was carried out by
the council or by the owner, the building’s usage (residential, industrial, business, etc) and
the nature of the maintenance to be carried out.

Please note that the following information is available via the Building Standards Register at
the link below: Details of notice / Date Issued / Date completed / Building Usage:
https://publicaccess.aberdeencity.gov.uk/online-applications/  
 
Click on the “Search” drop down menu and select Building Standards/Advanced then click on
the button “Notices.  Enter in Date Received 01/01/2013 to today and then click on Search. 
This will display all Dangerous, Defective and Enforcement Notices with the above
information.
 
As details of all dangerous building notices is otherwise accessible via the link provided, it is
exempt from disclosure.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing your request under
the terms of Regulation 6(1)(b)  - Information Already Publicly Available - of the EIRs
 
Please note that the nature of the maintenance work carried out is not recorded.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the nature of the maintenance to be
carried out as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice
that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to
inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining
this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is
satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information
held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
The amount spent by the council on the implementation of maintenance relating to
dangerous building notices each year since 2013.
The amount of spend where the council complete works is not recorded in an easily
retrievable format.  Retrieving this information will involve a manual search through 6 years
of invoices to determine and match any spend against an appropriate Notice.
 
This will involve a search through every invoice authorised for payment within the Building
Standards financial codes.  Each invoice will require to be read to determine the description



of works, the address the invoice relates to and then cross checked against the register of
Notices to find a match.  The invoice amount would then be manually recorded.
 
6 years of invoices would relate to approximately 3000 invoices.
Taking a conservative average of 5 minutes per invoice x 3000 = 15,000 minutes or 250
hours of officer time.   Therefore, the £600 at a cost of £15/hr will be exceeded after only 40
hours of searching.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on amount spent by the council as it is
excepted from disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing your request under
the terms of Regulation 10(4)(b) – Manifestly Unreasonable - of the EIRs.
 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:
 
ACC considers that this request is manifestly unreasonable as the length of time required to
collating all the information requested would seriously impede on the ACC’s duty to provide
other services to the public. There would also impact on the officer’s (who would examine
each transaction) daily tasks and other duties.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can
provide some information of interest to you that would not impact on other duties of our
officer . Please do contact the Access to Information team, who will be happy to advise you,
if this is something you would like to pursue.

               
The amount retrieved by the council from building owners as a result of maintenance
relating to dangerous building notices each year since 2013.
Please note that no monies have been retrieved from building owners as a result of
maintenance work completed by the council.
 

2. The details of all defective building notices served within the council area since 2013.
Please include the date issued, the date completed, whether the work was carried out by
the council or by the owner, the building’s usage (residential, industrial, business, etc) and
the nature of the maintenance to be carried out.

Please note that the following information is available via the Building Standards Register at
the link below: Details of notice / Date Issued / Date completed / Building Usage:
https://publicaccess.aberdeencity.gov.uk/online-applications/ 
 
Click on the “Search” drop down menu and select Building Standards/Advanced then click on
the button “Notices.  Enter in Date Received 01/01/2013 to today and then click on Search. 
This will display all Dangerous, Defective and Enforcement Notices with the above
information.
 
As details of all defective building notices is otherwise accessible via the link provided, it is
exempt from disclosure.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing your request under
the terms of Regulation 6(1)(b)  - Information Already Publicly Available - of the EIRs
 



Please note that the nature of the maintenance work carried out is not recorded.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the nature of the maintenance to be
carried out as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice
that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to
inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining
this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is
satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no information
held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
The amount spent by the council on the implementation of maintenance relating to
defective building notices each year since 2013.
The amount of spend where the council complete works is not recorded in an easily
retrievable format.  Retrieving this information will involve a manual search through 6 years
of invoices to determine and match any spend against an appropriate Notice.
 
This will involve a search through every invoice authorised for payment within the Building
Standards financial codes.  Each invoice will require to be read to determine the description
of works, the address the invoice relates to and then cross checked against the register of
Notices to find a match.  The invoice amount would then be manually recorded.
 
6 years of invoices would relate to approximately 3000 invoices.
Taking a conservative average of 5 minutes per invoice x 3000 = 15,000 minutes or 250
hours of officer time.   Therefore, the £600 at a cost of £15/hr will be exceeded after only 40
hours of searching.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on amount spent by the council as it is
excepted from disclosure. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing your request under
the terms of Regulation 10(4)(b) – Manifestly Unreasonable - of the EIRs.
 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:
 
ACC considers that this request is manifestly unreasonable as the length of time required to
collating all the information requested would seriously impede on the ACC’s duty to provide
other services to the public. There would also impact on the officer’s (who would examine
each transaction) daily tasks and other duties.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can
provide some information of interest to you that would not impact on other duties of our
officer . Please do contact the Access to Information team, who will be happy to advise you,
if this is something you would like to pursue.
 
The amount retrieved by the council from building owners as a result of maintenance
relating to defective building notices each year since 2013.
Please note that no monies have been retrieved from building owners as a result of
maintenance work completed by the council.



 
3. The details of all Demolition Notices served within the council area since 2013. Please

include the date issued, the date completed, whether the work was carried out by the
council or by the owner, the building’s usage (residential, industrial, business, etc) and the
reasons for demolition.

The amount spent by the council on the implementation of issued demolition notices
each year since 2013.
The amount retrieved by the council from building owners as a result of work carried out
under of demolition notices each year since 2013.
Please note that no Demolition Notices have been served since 2013.
 

4. The details of all Demolition Orders served within the council area since 2013. Please
include the date issued, the date completed, the building’s usage (residential, industrial,
business, etc) and the reasons for the closure.

The amount spent by the council on the implementation of demolition orders each year
since 2013.
The amount retrieved by the council from building owners as a result of work carried out
under demolition orders each year since 2013.
Please note that no Demolition Orders have been served since 2013.

 
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
 

Tomina Egbuson | Access to Information Officer
Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback
|Customer

Marischal College |Business Hub 17,  3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen |
AB10 1AQ
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