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From:                                         Foi Enquiries
Sent:                                           29 May 2019 10:32
To:                                               
Subject:                                     FOI-19-0596 - Childcare
Attachments:                          V3 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf; FOI-19-0596 - Guidance.pdf
 
Dear ,
 
Thank you for your clarified information request of 29 April 2019.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the necessary
search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below.
 
1. When does the Council start providing 16 hours of early learning and childcare funding for children? Is it strictly when the
Scottish Government provides funding for their place (the term after their third birthday) or is it earlier e.g. the day they
turn three or the week after? Please be as specific as possible. 

ACC offer funded places for children from the term after their 3rd birthday.
 
Birthday                                               Funded ELC begins
January to February                        April (after the Easter holidays)
March to August                              August (after the Summer holidays children may start once they have reached the age of 3)
September to December              January (after the Christmas holidays)
 
2. How many children whose fifth birthday fell between 1st March and the school commencement date in August has the
Council funded a further year of nursery for I.e. children who do not have a legal right to be deferred but whose
parents/carers have requested a discretionary deferral? Please provide the total number for each year from 2013 onwards. 
2013:     0
2014:     0
2015:     0
2016:     No figures available due to a change in IT system.
2017:     1
2018:     0
2019:     3
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many children whose fifth birthday fell between 1st March and the
school commencement date in August has the Council funded a further year of nursery for I.e. children who do not have a
legal right to be deferred but whose parents/carers have requested a discretionary deferral in 2016 as it is not held by ACC. 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it. 
 
3. Do you have an appeals process in place when the Council refuses funding for a further year of early learning and
childcare for a deferred year?
If a request is refused, the applicant can submit an appeal.  This takes the form of further evidence from professionals and the
family.  Information is submitted to the Deferred Entry Panel for review.
 
4a.Is the Council already providing 1140 hours of early learning and childcare funding for any children before the statutory
requirement to do so in August 2020? 
There are currently 10 places being trialled at Manor Park School with 17 children benefiting from this trial.  We plan to do
more trials in session 2019-2020. These are yet to be confirmed.
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4b. If yes, how many children in the local authority have been provided with 30 hours of early learning and childcare
funding this academic year ( 2018/2019)?
None as 17 individual children are receiving extended hours but not the full 1140 entitlement.
 
4c. If yes to 4a, please explain why.
Manor Park School is in one of our priority regeneration areas and had capacity to participate in a trial to test extended hours
prior to August 2020.
 
4d. If yes to 4a, please provide the criteria for children to be eligible for 1140 hours in 2018/2019.
Please see below the extract from ACC Early Learning and Childcare Admissions Policy 2019/20:
 
“Where Local Authority nurseries are able to offer early phasing of 1140 hours before the formal implementation date of
August 2020, places will be allocated to children who meet one of the following criteria:
 

1. Children in a deferred year of nursery (children who could have accessed school this year 2019-20, but have
chosen to provide their child with a deferred year due to their birth dates or successful deferred entry
application); Children who are Looked After and fall under Child Protection or Social Work criteria; or Children
who have speech and language communication disorder.

2. Parents who wish to return to learning and access college or university places or parents who are working.”

 
5a. How many 1140 hour places does the Council plan to fund in the coming academic year (2019 - 2020)?
ACC is unable to provide the required information. The number of the places will be determined in line with Early Learning and
Childcare Delivery Plan priorities.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many 1140 hour places does the Council plan to fund in the coming
academic year (2019 - 2020) as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of
the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
 
5b. What proportion is this of the total number of early learning and childcare places the Council antiticpates it will provide
in 2019/2020 e.g. 40% of cohort taking up a funded EL&C place, 100% etc
Not applicable, please the response to question above.
 
6. Please provide the detailed criteria which the Council's panel uses to assess discretionary deferral funding requests. 
Please find enclosed document ref: FOI-19-0596 - Guidance in relation to Deferred Entry application pack which parents and
professionals complete.
 
7. What proportion of Jan and Feb born children have deferred entry to primary school in the local authority each year
since 2013-2014 (as a proportion of the primary one year group when they first could have gone to school)? 
                        Jan/Feb Children                              P1 Figures                           %
2013/14                139                                                         Not available*
2014/15                127                                                         2294                                       5.5
2015/16                156                                                         2265                                       6.8
2016/17                160                                                         2233                                       7.2
2017/18                132                                                         2300                                       5.7
2018/19                149                                                         2114                                       7.0
2019/20                174                                                         Not yet available
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*The figures are not available due to changes in MIS system in 2013.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on what proportion of Jan and Feb born children have deferred entry to
primary school in the local authority in 2013/14 and 2019/20 as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply with its obligations
under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 

Salomeh Kheyri Rad | Access to Information Officer
Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback |Customer

Marischal College | Business Hub 17 | 3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 1AQ
 
Dial: 01224 522166
www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC

 
 



Please return to: Early Years Team, Frederick Street Centre, Frederick Street, AB24 5HY  
Email eyadmissions@aberdeencity.gov.uk 
 

 

Appendix 4 

 

Deferred Entry to Primary School 
Session 2019/2020 

 
What is deferred entry to primary school? 
 
Early Learning and Childcare (ELC) provision in Aberdeen City is designed to offer 
children a continuum of early learning experiences from nursery into Primary 1.  
However, for a few children it may be beneficial to have an additional year in nursery. 
 

Children who will be 5 years old between 1 March 2019 and 28 February 2020 
usually start primary school in August 2019.  However, it is beneficial for a few 
children to have an additional year at nursery to allow them time to mature and 
develop. 
 
 

If I choose to defer entry to Primary One, am I entitled to an ELC place? 
 

     Children whose birthdays are in January or February are guaranteed additional time 
in nursery should their parents or carers wish them to have this. Children whose 
birthdays fall between the beginning of the school term in August and the 31 
December may request an additional year.  The Local Authority has the discretion to 
agree to these requests.  Applications are considered by a multi agency panel. 
 
When do I need to decide? 
 
The decision should be taken during the year before the child would normally start 
school. 
 
How do I decide? 

When making this decision you can think about the following questions.  These 
should not be used as a checklist but may help you to think about your child’s 
strengths and areas for development. 
 

Is your child able to: 

• Communicate in their own language with adults and children? 

• Follow instructions e.g. tidy up, take a friend’s hand? 

• Listen to and respond to a story? 

• Express needs and talk about experiences? 

• Play with rhyming words and simple songs? 

• Match and sort objects? 

• Show an interest in the world of print and mark making? 

• Cope with small changes in their routine? 

• Form relationships, and be confident and happy? 
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What should I do if I want an ELC place for my child in his/her deferred year? 
 
Discuss the reasons you wish to request deferred entry with the staff at your child’s 
nursery who can submit an application with you to the Deferred Entry Panel.  
Applications can be made by your child’s “named person” or health professional 
should your child not attend a nursery.  
 
No deferred entry application is guaranteed. It is therefore recommended that you 
also apply for a Primary 1 place. 
 
Consider the long term implications of your child starting school later than their 
peers. Children can legally leave school at 16 and if they have been deferred this 
means they can choose to leave school before they have taken their qualifying 
examinations. 
 
What can you do to help? 
 

• Encourage your child to play with children of a similar age outside of nursery. 

• Establish a habit and ensure you read, talk and listen to your child every day. 

• Spend time playing with your child, talking and encouraging their imagination. 

• Encourage your child to collect, organise and match every day objects in 
different ways. 
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EARLY LEARNING AND CHILDCARE – DEFERRED ENTRY REQUEST 

(To be completed for children with August 2014  to December 2014 dates of birth)  

Child’s name  

Child’s date of birth  

Parent/Guardian’s name  

Child’s address 

 

 

 

 

Post Code 

Early Learning and Childcare  
Centre 

Currently attending……………………………. 

Started at this setting on…………. 

List any previous EL&C experience with start/leaving dates 

 

Which setting do the child’s parents intend to apply for? 
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Please provide information on the child’s progress within the early levels of the Curriculum for 
Excellence  
 
Comment on strengths and areas for development. 
 
You should consider 
Ability to manage emotions 
Social Skills 
Concentration 
Self help Skills  
Emerging literacy and numeracy skills 
Fine and gross motor skills 
Communication (listening and sharing their experiences) 
 
NB Children who would benefit from Deferred Entry generally have difficulties in more than 
one area. 
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How will the extra year in an EL&C setting benefit the child’s development? 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

What will the EL&C environment be able to provide that P1 won’t be able to provide? 

(apart from higher staffing ratio) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

What potential problems might this child experience in Primary One? 
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Person supporting the request 

Position in Nursery 

*Please Print 

 

Signature  

Who else is involved in 
supporting his child? 
   
 

Specify name and agency 

 

Parental comments: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Copy of this report given to 

parents (mandatory) 

Please tick here      
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Early Learning and Childcare Application Privacy Notice 

Why are we asking for your information? 

Aberdeen City Council collects and records information about you and your child on 
this application form as part of the process of providing you with Early Learning and 
Childcare. We will keep this information for 6 years from the date of application.  
If your child’s Health Visitor contacts us to ask if you have made an application on 
behalf of your child or to ask for an update on the status of your child’s application, 
we will share this information.  
 

Your Data, Your Rights 
You’ve got legal rights about the way the Council handles and uses your data, which 
include the right to ask for a copy of it, and to ask us to stop doing something with 
your data. Please contact the Council’s Data Protection Officer by email 
DataProtectionOfficer@aberdeencity.gov.uk or in writing at: Data Protection Officer, 
Aberdeen City Council, Business Hub 6, Level 1 South, Marischal College, 
Aberdeen, AB10 1AB.  
 
More information about all of the rights you have is available on our website at: 
https://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/your-data.  
 
You also have the right to make a complaint to the Information Commissioner’s 
Office, (www.ico.org.uk). They are the body responsible for making sure 
organisations like the Council handle your data lawfully.   

 
Legal Basis for Processing 
Aberdeen City Council is the Data Controller for this information about you. 
Wherever the Council processes personal data, we need to make sure we have a 
legal basis for doing so in data protection law. The Council understands our legal 
basis for processing personal data in as Article 6(1)(e) of the General Data 
Protection Regulation. This is because providing the entitlement to Early Learning 
and Childcare is part of our public task under the Children and Young People 
(Scotland) Act 2014.  In carrying out this task, the Council is also likely to process 
special categories of personal data. The Council understands our legal basis for 
doing so as Article 9(2)(g) of the General Data Protection Regulation, because 
processing is necessary for reasons of substantial public interest. 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 




