

From: Foi Enquiries
Sent: 10 April 2019 16:17
To: [REDACTED]
Subject: FOI-19-0445 - Councillor Diversity
Attachments: V2 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf

Dear [REDACTED],

Thank you for your information request of 26 March 2019. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the necessary search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below.

1. The number of councillors currently serving (including those standing down or up for re-election on 2 May, if applicable)
45.

2. Of those, how many are male? How many are female?

3. How many councillors are white (including British, English, Scottish, Irish, Welsh, Gypsy or Irish Traveller or any other white background)?

4. How many councillors are mixed (including white and black Caribbean, white and black African, white and Asian or any other mixed background)?

5. How many councillors are Asian or Asian British (including Indian, Pakistani, Bangladeshi, Chinese or any other Asian background)?

6. How many councillors are Black (including African, Caribbean, Black British or any other Black background)?

7. How many councillors are from any other ethnic group not referred to above?

8. How many councillors are in each of these age ranges:

18-24

25-34

35-44

45-54

55-64

65+

Aberdeen City Council does not record any of this information as we have no requirement to do so.

ACC is unable to provide you with information on **how many are male, How many are female, How many are white, How many are mixed, How many are Asian or Asian British, How many are Black or age** as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

Information on our Councillors is published on our website at the following link:

<https://committees.aberdeencity.gov.uk/mgMemberIndex.aspx?bcr=1>

INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST

ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.

We hope this helps with your request.

Yours sincerely,

Grant Webster
Access to Information Officer

Grant Webster | Access to Information Officer

Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback | Customer
Marischal College | Business Hub 17, 3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 1AQ

Dial: 01224 522166

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC