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From:                                         Foi Enquiries
Sent:                                           07 March 2019 08:42
To:                                               
Subject:                                     FOI-19-0239 - School Dinners
Attachments:                          V2 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf; FOI-19-0239 School Dinners Q1.csv; FOI-

19-0239 School Dinners Q3.csv
 
Dear ,
 
Thank you for your information request of 08 February 2019.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the necessary search
for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below.
 
Please provide me with information relating to cashless/ digital school meal payments systems. Please break down the
following answers by primary and secondary school, and by the academic years 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19:
 
1. How many transactions were made by children to purchase food?
Please find attached spreadsheet  FOI-19-0239 School Dinners Q1. Please note that some primary schools only went live during
2017/2018 and the spreadsheet indicates where this is the case.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with some information on the amount of transactions for each school for the academic years
2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 as it is not held by ACC. This is because some schools were not live during the requested
period. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it. 
 
2. How many accounts were active?
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the amount of live accounts for the academic years 2016/17, 2017/18 and
2018/19 as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. This is because the software used only allows access to the active
accounts, and staff cannot access historical levels of accounts unless the information had been downloaded at the time.
 
However, we can provide a snapshot of the amount of live accounts as of 19 February 2019. We hope this is helpful for you.
 
As of 19 February 2019, there were 16,537 live accounts.
 
3. How much money was loaded onto cards/ into the system over the year?
Please find attached spreadsheet FOI-19-0239 School Dinners Q3. Please note that some primary schools only went live during
2017/2018 and the spreadsheet indicates where this is the case.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with some information on how much money was loaded onto our cashless system for the
academic years 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 as it is not held by ACC. This is because some schools were not live during the
requested period. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice
that this information is not held by it. 
 
4. How many times did a child’s account become overdrawn due to a lack of funds when they purchased food?
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many occasions a child’s account became overdrawn as the cost of
providing it has been calculated as being in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  To explain this, it would involve an ACC
Officer going through each child’s individual account to extract the information. We have based our calculations on the current
snapshot of 16,537 live accounts as of 19 February 2019 as a baseline for this year. This has been calculated at 10 minutes per
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child account, which equates to 2756 hours, at the cost of £41,432.50 in total.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing
your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of Compliance - of the FOISA.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide some information of interest to
you within the maximum cost limits. Please do contact the Access to Information team, who will be happy to advise you, if this
is something you would like to pursue.
 
5. How many times did a child with an already-overdrawn account make a purchase, becoming even more overdrawn?
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many occasions an overdrawn account became further overdrawn as
the cost of providing it has been calculated as being in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  To explain this, it would
involve an ACC Officer going through each child’s individual account to extract the information. We have based our calculations
on the current snapshot of 16,537 live accounts as of 19 February 2019 as a baseline for this year. This has been calculated at
10 minutes per child account, which equates to 2756 hours, at the cost of £41,432.50 in total.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing
your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of Compliance - of the FOISA.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide some information of interest to
you within the maximum cost limits. Please do contact the Access to Information team, who will be happy to advise you, if this
is something you would like to pursue.
 
6. What were the values of the three accounts which were most overdrawn at any point during the year?
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the value of the three most overdrawn accounts for the academic years
2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 as it is not held by ACC. This is because the software used only allows access to the active
accounts, and staff cannot access historical levels of accounts unless the information had been downloaded at the time. In
order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is
not held by it. 
 
However we can provide a snapshot of the amount of three most overdrawn accounts as of 19 February 2019 below. We hope
this is helpful for you.
 

- 1,242.15
- 999.25
- 970.20

 
7. How many accounts had a negative value/ were overdrawn at the end of the school year?
For the 2018-19 financial year, please tell me how many accounts were overdrawn on the date the email was received. (07
February 2019)
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many accounts were overdrawn/or had a negative value as the cost of
providing it has been calculated as being in excess of the statutory maximum (£600).  To explain this, it would involve an ACC
Officer going through each child’s individual account to extract the information. We have based our calculations on the current
snapshot of 16,537 live accounts as of 19 February 2019 as a baseline for this year. This has been calculated at 10 minutes per
child account, which equates to 2756 hours, at the cost of £41,432.50 in total.
 
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby give notice that we are refusing
your request under the terms of Section 12 - Excessive Cost of Compliance - of the FOISA.



file:///O|/...I/Case%20Files/2019/FOI-0201-0300/FOI-19-0239%20%20-%20School%20Dinners/FOI-19-0239%20-%20School%20Dinners.htm[07/03/2019 08:45:44]

 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide some information of interest to
you within the maximum cost limits. Please do contact the Access to Information team, who will be happy to advise you, if this
is something you would like to pursue.
 
We have provided the amount of accounts withdrawn as of 19 February 2019 below.
 

Number of Overdrawn
Accounts 3224

 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the amount of overdrawn accounts on  07 February 2019 as it is not held by
ACC. This is because the software used only allows access to the active accounts, and staff cannot access historical levels of
accounts unless the information had been downloaded at the time. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Claire Barranger-Clark
Senior Access to Information Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.
 
 
Grant Webster |Access to Information Officer
Aberdeen City Council | Access to Information Team | Customer Feedback |Customer

Marischal College |Business Hub 17,  3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 1AQ
 
Dial: 01224 522166
www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC
 



Secondary School 2016‐2017 2017‐2018 2018‐2019

Aberdeen Grammar 121,815 145,808 92,451

Bucksburn 110,264 119,362 76,824

BOD 72,317 63,895 44,888

Cults 297,941 297,160 178,449

Dyce  73,985 55,662 29,625

Harlaw 77,356 83,837 54,812

Hazlehead 174,568 179,489 105,345

Kincorth 2016‐2018 123,577 88,227 NA

Lochside 2018‐2019 NA NA 116,552

Northfield 84,021 93,765 63,011

Oldmachar 81,652 67,331 44,773

St Machar 91,358 94,778 59,660

Torry 47,358 42,643 NA

NA

Primary School 2016‐2017 2017‐2018 2018‐2019 School Went Live

Abbotswell School 8,353 24,235 15,474 02/03/2017

Airyhall School 39,754 48,872 21,399 Pre 01/08/2016

Ashley Road School NA 24,203 22,086 22/11/2017

Braehead School NA 4,964 16,999 14/05/2018

Bramble Brae School NA 9,848 12,798 19/02/2018

Brimmond School 32,290 37,389 21,259 Pre 01/08/2016

Broomhill School NA NA 10,294 03/12/2018

Charleston School 17,294 21,892 11,035 24/10/2016

Cornhill School NA 29,393 21,102 20/11/2017

Culter School 18,557 46,475 24,400 27/02/2017

Cults School 78,326 85,092 48,941 Pre 01/08/2016

Danestone School NA NA 12,488 17/09/2018

Dyce School 2,222 43,447 25,025 19/06/2017

Fernielea School 25,632 27,301 14,316 31/08/2016

Ferryhill School 2,963 29,323 18,308 NA

Forehill School NA NA 8,445 25/10/2018

Gilcomstoun School 2,103 26,686 14,554 12/06/2017

Glashieburn School 24,207 27,455 13,550 27/09/2016

Greenbrae School NA 18,717 13,588 02/10/2017

Hanover Street School NA 11,092 13,375 05/02/2018

Hazlehead School 4,246 35,916 20,290 29/05/2017

Heathyburn Primary School NA 24,927 17,461 20/11/2017

Holy Family RC School NA 11,521 4,690 30/10/2017

Kaimhill School 11,830 28,627 17,404 09/02/2017

Kingsford School 3,124 28,998 13,419 31/05/2017

Kingswells School NA 18,936 30,180 19/03/2018

Kirkhill School 7,105 23,932 12,978 07/03/2017

Kittybrewster School NA NA 7,956 19/11/2018

Loirston School 15,142 29,998 17,602 16/01/2017

Manor Park School NA 12,194 26,981 19/02/2018



Middleton Park School NA 14,712 13,180 08/01/2018

Mile‐End School NA 47,546 30,592 02/10/2017

Milltimber School 12,541 33,567 19,130 02/03/2017

Muirfield School NA 12,916 7,195 02/10/2017

Orchard Brae NA NA 4,597 01/10/2018

Quarryhill School NA 23,896 14,786 11/09/2017

Riverbank School NA NA 10,652 26/11/2018

Scotstown School NA NA 9,283 08/10/2018

Seaton School NA 4,305 13,487 28/05/2018

Skene Square School NA 24,577 19,993 27/11/2017

St Peter's RC School NA 3,118 12,554 04/06/2018

St. Josephs RC School 8,590 49,973 27,573 15/05/2017

Stoneywood School NA NA 13,088 21/08/2018

Sunnybank School & ASfD NA 31,352 20,490 06/10/2017

Tullos School 32,741 33,182 16,320 Pre 01/08/2016

Walker Road School 35,551 32,819 17,265 Pre 01/08/2016

Westpark School NA 22,978 12,791 11/09/2017

Woodside School NA 1,572 17,597 25/06/2018



Secondary School 2016‐2017 2017‐2018 2018‐2019

Aberdeen Grammar £126,093.93 £139,682.82 £87,989.47

Bucksburn £126,657.87 £178,405.56 £80,639.27

BOD £73,174.46 £65,202.53 £49,256.65

Cults £311,118.22 £305,851.96 £189,370.02

Dyce  £57,695.52 £57,236.62 £28,373.80

Harlaw £87,246.75 £95,026.05 £60,699.09

Hazlehead £152,800.84 £156,888.18 £95,123.07

Kincorth/Lochside (2018‐2019) £76,342.09 £78,838.12 £119,238.55

Northfield £62,513.59 £68,758.58 £50,449.90

Oldmachar £91,853.59 £74,876.16 £48,573.68

St Machar £68,566.13 £64,733.03 £43,482.23

Torry £41,058.74 £34,204.33 NA 

Primary School  Date Live 2016‐2017 2017‐2018 2018‐2019

Abbotswell School 02/03/2017 £6,262.49 £16,467.85 £11,022.66

Airyhall School Pre 01/08/2016 £43,628.27 £50,259.75 £32,757.31

Ashley Road School 22/11/2017 £16,951.50 £14,644.39

Braehead School 14/05/2018 £3,621.05 £14,538.35

Bramble Brae School 19/02/2018 £2,213.60 £3,468.55

Brimmond School Pre 01/08/2016 £19,955.37 £21,192.15 £2,916.85

Broomhill School 03/12/2018 £‐    £‐    £10,161.60

Charleston School 24/10/2016 £19,319.06 £20,253.33 £9,872.87

Cornhill School 20/11/2017 £‐    £14,115.94 £9,439.57

Culter School 27/02/2017 £21,434.52 £47,910.43 £26,080.40

Cults School Pre 01/08/2016 £79,014.75 £96,436.67 £52,743.39

Danestone School 17/09/2018 £‐    £‐    £15,325.62

Dyce School 19/06/2017 £2,039.80 £32,672.20 £17,113.32

Fernielea School 31/08/2016 £20,229.38 £20,196.79 £9,851.24

Ferryhill School £2,199.70 £20,483.25 £12,080.25

Forehill School 25/10/2018 £‐    £‐    £7,974.26

Gilcomstoun School 12/06/2017 £1,106.60 £14,462.50 £8,956.48

Glashieburn School 27/09/2016 £26,611.91 £28,509.69 £13,874.69

Greenbrae School 02/10/2017 £‐    £12,765.50 £11,219.61

Hanover Street School 05/02/2018 £‐    £5,778.65 £7,246.77

Hazlehead School 29/05/2017 £4,442.30 £30,595.30 £18,736.24

Heathyburn Primary School 20/11/2017 £‐    £10,955.50 £7,548.88

Holy Family RC School 30/10/2017 £‐    £9,839.40 £8,279.40

Kaimhill School 09/02/2017 £4,750.35 £13,672.79 £7,935.64

Kingsford School 31/05/2017 £1,857.36 £15,423.52 £5,004.55

Kingswells School 19/03/2018 £‐    £18,544.13 £33,232.08

Kirkhill School 07/03/2017 £3,086.11 £10,614.85 £5,135.95

Kittybrewster School 19/11/2018 £‐    £‐    £4,640.96

Loirston School 16/01/2017 £15,456.72 £27,667.08 £17,340.14



Manor Park School 19/02/2018 £‐    £5,034.63 £5,107.31

Middleton Park School 08/01/2018 £‐    £14,742.86 £13,559.74

Mile‐End School 02/10/2017 £‐    £46,342.46 £28,427.94

Milltimber School 02/03/2017 £13,372.60 £33,797.91 £19,327.61

Muirfield School 02/10/2017 £‐    £4,220.47 £1,617.40

Orchard Brae 01/10/2018 £‐    £‐    £4,853.03

Quarryhill School 11/09/2017 £‐    £11,656.96 £6,324.97

Riverbank School 26/11/2018 £‐    £‐    £4,335.88

Scotstown School 08/10/2018 £‐    £‐    £11,238.73

Seaton School 28/05/2018 £‐    £2,165.20 £7,503.30

Skene Square School 27/11/2017 £‐    £14,444.34 £11,617.38

St Peter's RC School 04/06/2018 £‐    £1,983.00 £8,109.90

St. Josephs RC School 15/05/2017 £8,821.56 £48,062.00 £24,265.92

Stoneywood School 21/08/2018 £‐    £‐    £16,757.02

Sunnybank School & ASfD 06/10/2017 £‐    £15,159.08 £11,082.08

Tullos School Pre 01/08/2016 £5,783.46 £9,029.95 £3,726.45

Walker Road School Pre 01/08/2016 £11,880.85 £12,117.40 £6,766.39

Westpark School 11/09/2017 £‐    £16,299.98 £10,087.71

Woodside School 25/06/2018 £‐    £758.34 £9,136.72




