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From:                                         Foi Enquiries
Sent:                                           01 November 2018 14:19
To:                                               
Subject:                                     FOI-18-1635 - No Next of Kin
Attachments:                          V2 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf
 
Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 31 October 2018.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the necessary search
for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below.

I would like to know details of anyone who has died with no known next of kin from 1/8/2018 to the day of your reply. If
there are any new cases where the person died prior to 1/8/2018, but that were only dealt with after this date, please also
include details. This should include deaths of any clients whose affairs are managed by the Councils Safeguarding or
Deputy-ship Teams, where applicable.
ACC does not deal with deceased persons who have no known next of kin unless they were Social Care clients.  In all cases
where someone dies with no traceable family, the case is referred to the National Ultimus Haeres Unit of the Crown &
Procurator Fiscals Office in Glasgow. Information on the National Ultimus Unit can be found at
http://qltr.gov.uk/content/overview or by contacting them at the address below:
 
National Ultimus Haeres Unit
Procurator Fiscals Office
10 Ballater Street
GLASGOW
G5 9PS
Telephone Number: 0844 561 4846
Fax Number: 0844 561 4839
Email: NationalUltimusHaeresUnit@copfs.gsi.gov.uk
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on details of anyone who has died with no known next of kin from 1/8/2018
to the day of reply as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA,
ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

Please also supply a list of any Public Health Act Funerals carried out from the above date (also known as Welfare or
Environmental Health Act funerals) if this does not form part of your reply to the above. This should include funerals carried
out by the council or on behalf of any third party.  If possible please include as much of the following information as you
are able to:

1.       the deceased's full names
2.       the date they died
3.       the approximate value of their estate
4.       their date and place of birth or age at death
5.       whether or not they were married, divorced, single, or widowed
6.       the maiden surnames of married females or widows
7.       their  address at death
8.       the date when a referral was made of this estate to any other 3rd party or body to research or administer and the
name of the 3rd party concerned.
9.       If a referral to a 3rd party or body  has not yet been made could you advise of the case details as above too.
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10.  If a case referral to a 3rd party or body is still  undecided or awaiting referral, please also advise of details of the case as
above.
For public funerals where the next of kin is known, ACC is unable to provide you with information on the deceased’s full
names, the date they died, their date and place of birth or age at death, whether or not they were married, divorced, single
or widowed, the maiden surnames of married females or widows and their address at death as it is exempt from disclosure.
In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 16 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that we are refusing
your request under the terms of Section 38(1)(b) in conjunction with 38(2A)(a) – of the FOISA.
 
In making this decision ACC considered the following points:
 
ACC is of the opinion that Section 38(1)(b) applies to the information specified above as the information in question is personal
information relating to living individuals, of which the applicant is not the data subject.  ACC considers that releasing this
information would allow the identification of the deceased’s next of kin or close relatives, and we therefore must consider that
this information is the personal information of these individuals, and Section 38(1)(b) applies to this information.  Further, ACC
is of the opinion that Section 38(2A)(a) applies, as we consider that disclosure of this information would be a breach of the
‘lawfulness, fairness and transparency’ principle. ACC believes releasing this information about deceased persons will allow the
identification of their next of kin or close relatives, something which these individuals have not consented to, and would have
no expectation that ACC would release.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the approximate value of their estate, date when a referral was made of
this estate to any other 3rd party or body to research or administer and the name of the 3rd party concerned and if a case
referral to a 3rd party or details of the case as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of
Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.

   
Anna Buchan | Information Compliance Officer
Aberdeen City Council | Information Compliance Team | Customer Feedback |Customer

Marischal College | 3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 1AQ
 
Dial: 01224 522166
www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC

 
 
 




