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From:                                         Foi Enquiries
Sent:                                           19 November 2018 15:31
To:                                               '
Subject:                                     FOI-18-1547 - City Centre Shopping Area
Attachments:                          V2 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf
 
Dear ,
 
Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay in responding to your information request of 18 October 2018. Aberdeen City
Council (ACC) has completed the necessary search for the information requested. Our response is now detailed below.
 
For 2007, 2012 and 2017 (full calendar years) can you please provide the following information? Please note this is in
relation to Aberdeen's city centre shopping area. The area I am interested in in Aberdeen is Union Square.
 
1. What was the level of business rates been for each year per square foot?
This information is not held by ACC. We would advise you to contact the Grampian Assessor who may be able to answer.
 
https://www.grampian-vjb.gov.uk/contact-form/
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on the level of business rates been for each year per square foot as it is not
held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that
this information is not held by it.
 
2. How many retail premises were closed or been left vacant?
This information is not held by ACC. We would advise you to contact Union Square Developments Ltd, the owner of the
shopping centre. An address for them can be found here:
 
https://beta.companieshouse.gov.uk/company/SC195182
 
3. What was the average council-controlled parking cost (please share the tariffs for council car parks in the city)?
 

Tariff
Car Park 2007 2012 2017

Chapel Street Car Park

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
60p up to 2 hours £1.10 2 - 3
hours
£1.50 3 - 4 hours
£2.00 4 · 5 hours
£2.40 5 - 6 hours
£4.00 6 - 10 hours

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)
Mon-Sat
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Denburn Car Park

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
60p up to 2 hours £1.10 2 - 3
hours
£1.50 3 - 4 hours
£2.00 4 · 5 hours
£2.40 5 - 6 hours
£4.00 6 - 10 hours

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£1.00 up to 1 hour
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

Frederick Street Car Park N/A

Mon - Sat
8am - 10pm
Sundays
1pm - 5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 up to 3 hours
£4.00 up to 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Floors 5&6
 
Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)
Ground Floor and Floors 1-4
 
Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£1.00 up to 1 hour
£2.20 up to 2 hours
£3.30 2 - 3 hours
£4.40 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
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Gallowgate Car Park
80p up to 2 hours
£1.40 2 - 3 hours
£2.00 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period
of stay - 4 hours)

£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

£2.20 up to 2 hours
£3.30 2 - 3 hours
£4.40 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Golden Square Inner Circle
Off-Street Car Park

N/A

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£1.00 up to 20 minutes
£2.00 up to 40 minutes
£3.00 up to 1 hour
(maximum period of
stay - 1 hour)
Additionally after
6pm: £4.00 up to 2
hours

Marischal College Car Park
(available to public Thurs
6pm – 8pm and Sat 8am to
Sun 10pm)

N/A

Mon - Fri
6pm -10pm
Saturdays
8am-6pm
Sundays
1pm - 5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 up to 3 hours
£4.00 up to 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Mon - Fri
6pm -8pm
Saturdays
8am-8pm
Sundays
1pm - 5pm
 
£2.20 up to 2 hours
£3.30 2 - 3 hours
£4.40 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Summer Street

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
80p up to 2 hours
£1.40 2 - 3 hours
£2.00 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period
of stay- 4 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.20 up to 2 hours
£3.30 2 - 3 hours
£4.40 3 - 4 hours
(maximum period of
stay - 4 hours)

Virginia Street Car Park

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
60p up to 2 hours £1.10 2 - 3

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
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hours
£1.50 3 - 4 hours
£2.00 4 · 5 hours
£2.40 5 - 6 hours
£4.00 6 - 10 hours

£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

West North Street Car Park

Mon-Sat
8am-6pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
60p up to 2 hours £1.10 2 - 3
hours
£1.50 3 - 4 hours
£2.00 4 · 5 hours
£2.40 5 - 6 hours
£4.00 6 - 10 hours

Mon-Sat
8am-10pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

Mon-Sat
8am-8pm
Sun
1pm-5pm
 
£2.00 up to 2 hours
£3.00 2 - 3 hours
£4.00 3 - 4 hours
£5.00 4 - 5 hours
£6.00 5 - 6 hours
£10.00 6 - 10 hours
£14.00 10-14 hours
(maximum period of
stay -14 hours)

 
4. What was the total number of cars that used council run parking facilities and what is the maximum capacity at council
run parking facilities?
 

Car Park Capacity
Chapel Street Car Park 500 Parking Bays + dedicated bay for approx 6 motorcycles
Denburn Car Park 320 Parking Bays + dedicated bay for approx 6 motorcycles
Frederick Street Car Park 185 Parking Bays
Gallowgate Car Park 138 Parking Bays + dedicated bay for approx 6 motorcycles
Golden Square Inner Circle Off-Street Car Park 36 Parking Bays
Marischal College Car Park (available to public Thurs 6pm –
8pm and Sat 8am to Sun 10pm)

103 Parking Bays

Summer Street 23 Parking Bays + dedicated bay for approx 4 motorcycles
Virginia Street Car Park 45 Parking Bays
West North Street Car Park 165 Parking Bays

 
I am afraid that we are unable to confirm the total number of cars which used Council run parking facilities during the time
periods requested, as this information is not held.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on total number of cars that used council run parking facilities as it is not held
by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it.
 
5. How many private car parks did you licence?
a. If the information is available, what was/is the total capacity of licensed car parks for each of these years?
Unfortunately, we are unable to answer this question. We have checked with all the Services within ACC that we can think of
and no-one seems to hold any information in relation to this. We checked with our Licensing colleagues who advised that the
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licensing of private car parks isn’t something they deal with.
 
Perhaps, you could provide us with some more information to help us undertake further searches for you?
 
6. What was the average single journey bus charge?
Average single journey bus charges are not held, as the local authority does not hold patronage data to allow an average to be
calculated. The information provided is for the actual single fares available on the two main bus operators.
 
2007 – Not held due to retention periods.
2012:
 

Bus Operator Stages 1-2 Stages 3-5 Stages 6+
First Aberdeen £1.10 £2.00 £2.40
Stagecoach Bluebird £1.00 £1.50 £2.00

 
2017:
 

Bus Operator Stages 1-2 Stages 3-5 Stages 6+
First Aberdeen £1.50 £2.50 £2.50
Stagecoach Bluebird £1.30 £1.95 £2.50

 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on average single journey bus charge as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply
with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.
 
7. What was the number of bus journeys that terminated or started in the city centre?
This information is not available as the local authority only holds copies of bus services registrations and does not record the
number of journeys for certain locations.
 
Current bus service registrations could be utilised to show the volume of services entering the City Centre and can be viewed
at:
• www.firstgroup.com/aberdeen/plan-journey/timetables/
• https://www.stagecoachbus.com/timetables
 
Alternatively the Council’s Public Transport Guide 2017, indicates all services operating in the City and shows which services
entered the City Centre, but this does not provide the number of journeys, the guide can be viewed at:
• https://aberdeencity.gov.uk/services/roads-transport-and-parking/public-transport/aberdeen-city-public-transport-guide
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on number of bus journeys as it is not held by ACC. Number of bus journeys in
the City Centre is not information we are required to hold. Bus services in Aberdeen are generally operated on a commercial
basis by private bus companies. They are required to consult on bus service registrations with the authority and we hold records
of such. These are not broken down to number of journeys. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section
17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.
 
8. If a local park and ride is available – what was the cost per return journey?
2007 – Not held due to retention periods.
2012 - £3.00
2017 - £3.50
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ACC is unable to provide you with information on the cost per return journey in 2007 as it is not held by ACC. In order to
comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held
by it.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.
 
 

Grant Webster | Information Compliance Officer
Aberdeen City Council | Information Compliance Team | Customer Feedback |Customer

Marischal College | 3rd Floor | Broad Street | Aberdeen | AB10 1AQ
 
Dial: 01224 522166
www.aberdeencity.gov.uk | Twitter: @AberdeenCC | Facebook.com/AberdeenCC

 
 




