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From:                                         Foi Enquiries
Sent:                                           15 August 2018 14:58
To:                                               
Subject:                                     FOI-18-1084 - Council Tax
Attachments:                          V2 - Further Information - Right to Review & Appeal.pdf
 
Dear ,
 
Thank you for your information request of 19 July 2018. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has completed the necessary search for
the information requested.

 
In addition to the above please answer the following questions under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002:
 
1. How many reminder letters were issued by ACC within the last 12 months on alleged outstanding / overdue council tax?
For the financial year 2017/18 there were 45,097 reminder letters issued.
 
2. How many of these reminder letters referred to under (1) have later been determent to have been issued in error (and
had to be subsequently withdrawn)?
Information not held. There is no requirement for ACC to record this information.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on How many of these reminder letters referred to under (1) have later been
determent to have been issued in error (and had to be subsequently withdrawn)? as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply
with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.
 
3. How many summary warrants (or equivalent) has ACC issued in the last 12 months?
In terms of legislation, Summary Warrants are not issued by ACC to individuals but instead a summary warrant application is
made to the court.
 
For the financial year 2017/18 there were 20 summary warrants applications made to the court which included lists of 20,288
accounts.
 
It should be noted that the total number on the lists indicate all liable person(s) names pertaining to the account as one entry
i.e. husband and wife who are jointly liable will appear once on the list.
 
However, there can also be separate entries on the lists for more than one financial years’ outstanding Council tax which should
also be taken into account in the figures.
 
4. How many of these summary warrants (or equivalent) had subsequently been found to have been issued in error?
Not applicable, see our response above.
 
3. Has ACC been subject to a legal claim brought against it by individuals who are liable to pay council tax where the
authority has issued either a reminder letters or summary warrant (or equivalent) in error and if so what is the total
number of claims brought against ACC and how many of those were subsequently (a) settled (b) decided in favour of the
individual (c) decided in favour of ACC?
There have been no claims made against Aberdeen City Council.
 
4. How many complaints have been made to ACC by council tax payers because it is alleged that ACC did not
(a) correctly set up a direct debit
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4 complaints made.
 
(b) collect payments despite an direct debit.
2 complaints made.
 
5. In relation to 4 above, how many of these complaints have been upheld by ACC?
All 6 complaints upheld.
 
Please note, we follow the Scottish Local Authority Complaints Handling Procedure, which was introduced in 2012. Under this
procedure, a ‘complaint’ is defined as “an expression of dissatisfaction regarding our actions, or lack of action, or the standard
of service provided by us or on our behalf”. There are some topics that cannot be considered as a ‘complaint’, such as a first-
time request for a service.
 
For more information please visit www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/complaints.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act
2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under FOISA.
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*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).

 
 




