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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 02 April 2018.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
1.How many council tax payers paid their bills on time?
a. What was the total monetary value?
ACC is unable to provide you the required details as is not held, however, the undernoted
figures show the  Council Tax billed and collected (excluding surcharges):
 

2016/17                                2017/18
£thousands                        £thousands
 

Total billed                                          £105,934                              £112,828
Total collected                                   £102,279                              £107,142
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on how many council tax payers paid their bills
on time and what was the total monetary value as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply
with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it. 
 
2.How many citizens were sent council tax reminder letters?
2016/17: 47,481
2017/18: 45,097
a. What was the total monetary value unpaid at this stage?
2016/17: £6,148,638
2017/18: £6,310,030
The above figures include Council tax, Water and Waste Water. Kindly note that where there is
more than one liable person named on a Council tax account, (includes Water and Waste
Water), separate documentation must be issued for reminders, finals and broken arrangement
letters.
However, there can also be separate entries on the lists for more than one financial years’
outstanding Council Tax which should also be taken into account in the figures.
3.How many people were given a summary warrant over unpaid council tax?
2016/17: 19,717
2017/18: 20,288
a.How many of these cases proceeded to court, what were the outcomes and what there the
sums due?
The number of the cases proceeded to court is the same as the number of the given summary
warrant. Please refer to the response to Question 3.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on what were the outcomes of the cases
proceeded to court as it is not held by ACC.  In order to comply with its obligations under the



terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. 
 
The sums due are as follows:
2016/17: £15,941,841
2017/18: £15,495,720
 
i.If these details are unavailable, please provide me with the lowest and highest values owed.
N/A
Kindly note that where there is more than one liable person named on a Council tax account,
(includes Water and Waste Water) separate documentation must be issued for reminders, finals
and broken arrangement letters.
Where the account progresses to Warrant Petition, Warrant Granted and Sheriff Officer, the
lists indicate all liable person(s) names pertaining to the account as one entry i.e. husband and
wife who are jointly liable will have received separate reminders but will only appear once on
the list pertaining to the financial year.
However, there can also be separate entries on the lists for more than one financial years’
outstanding Council Tax which should also be taken into account in the figures.
In addition, please tell me:
4.How many elected councillors received council tax reminder letters?
None
a.If possible, please identify the individuals.
N/A
 
5.How many councillors were given were given a summary warrant over unpaid council tax?
None
a.If possible, please identify the individuals and/or the amounts owed.
N/A
b.What were the outcomes of these cases?
N/A
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
 
Information Compliance Team
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
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www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).

 




