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Dear 
 
Thank you for your information request of 10 April 2018.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
a) The combined total number of speed humps, bumps, cushions and tables currently
installed in your local authority area
The Council does not hold a record of the total number of speed humps etc. currently installed
in Aberdeen City. Attached, however, is a list of roads in the city where all, or part of, the length
of road has regular vertical traffic calming features such as Road Humps, Speed Cushions, Speed
Tables etc.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The combined total number of speed humps,
bumps, cushions and tables currently installed in your local authority area as it is not held by
the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) -
Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by
it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public
interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this
information and considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the
exception.
 
b) The height of the largest speed hump, bump, cushion or table installed in your local
authority area
The highest road hump, cushion or table feature would be 100mm at its highest point from an
imaginary line parallel to the centre line of the carriageway on one side of the road hump to the
surface of the carriageway on the other side of the road hump and passing vertically below that
point. For information the aforementioned height will generally be associated with kerb-to-kerb
speed tables that have been installed in Aberdeen City.
 
c) The height of the smallest speed hump, bump, cushion or table installed in your local
authority area
There is a not a formal record of the smallest road hump feature in Aberdeen City, however the
minimum used is generally 75mm and this is mostly associated with speed cushions.
 
d) The amount of compensation paid out by your local authority to drivers for damage to
cars caused by speed humps, bumps, cushions or tables, broken down by year for 2015,
2016, 2017 and 2018 to date.
For all years requested, the amount of compensation paid out to drivers for damage to cars
caused by speed humps, bumps, cushions or tables is £nil.
 
e) Does your local authority have any plans to remove any speed humps, bumps, cushions or



tables in your area?
There are no current plans to remove any vertical type traffic calming features (road humps etc.)
that have been installed in Aberdeen City.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Grant Webster
Information Compliance Officer
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 
As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
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