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Dear ,
 
Thank you for your information request of 25 January 2017.  Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

 
Please provide me with information relating to compensation claims regarding damage from
potholes and other road defects in the 2014/15, 2015/16, 2016/17 and 2017/18 financial
years, with full breakdowns of each instance.
 
a) The date of the incident
ACC is unable to provide this information. Please see our explanation below.
 
b) The location of the incident
ACC is unable to provide this information. Please see our explanation below.
 
c) The type and size of the defect claimed to have damaged the vehicle
This information is not held by ACC.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The type and size of the defect claimed to
have damaged the vehicle as it is not held by the Council.  In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b)
of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case, the public interest in
maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this information to you. 
ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as there is no
information held, the public interest lies with the exception.
 
d) The damage caused to the vehicle
This information is not held by ACC.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The damage caused to the vehicle as it is not
held by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation
10(4)(a) - Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not
held by it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public
interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this
information and considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the
exception.
 
e) If the claim was successful, and why it was approved
Claims are approved when the Council were found to be negligent.
 
f) How much was paid out?



ACC is unable to provide this information. Please see our explanation below.
 
g) When the defect was repaired
This information is not held by ACC.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on When the defect was repaired as it is not held
by the Council.  In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) -
Information Not Held - of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by
it.  ACC is required by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the
circumstances of the case, the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public
interest in disclosing this information to you.  ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this
information and considers that, as there is no information held, the public interest lies with the
exception.
 
Please see the information published on our website which shows number of claims, number of
paid claims and total compensation paid. Please note that we are unable to provide details of
specific payments or a description of the claim, as we are unable to release information that may
lead to the identification of any individual(s).
 
https://www.aberdeencity.gov.uk/services/council-and-democracy/financial-information-and-
procurement/corporate-insurance
 
Considering the above, ACC also consider that to extract the information you have requested
would require the analysis of approximately 840 claims. Each claim would have to be analysed
individually, resulting in approximately 10 minutes per claim, resulting in 140 hours of work.
 
It is considered that this work would be manifestly unreasonable to undertake. There is only one
person processing claims for ACC, which is a time sensitive task. Collating all the information
requested would seriously impede the officer from undertaking other duties.
 
ACC is unable to provide you with information on The date of the incident, The location of the
incident and How much was paid out as it is excepted from disclosure. In order to comply with
its obligations under the terms of Regulation 13 of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that we are
refusing your request under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(b) – Manifestly Unreasonable - of the
EIRs.
 
ACC would be happy to discuss ways in which you may refine your request, so we can provide
some information of interest to you. Please do contact the Information Compliance team, who
will be happy to advise you, if this is something you would like to pursue.
 
We hope this helps with your request.
 
Yours sincerely,
 
Information Compliance Team
 
INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
 



As the information which you requested is environmental information, as defined under
Regulation 2(1) of the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (the EIRs), ACC
considered that it was exempt from release through FOISA, and must therefore give you notice
that we are refusing  your request under Section 39(2) of FOISA (Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002).  However, you have a separate right to access the information which you
have requested under Regulation 5 of the EIRs, under which ACC has handled your request.
Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about your rights under the EIRs.
 
 
Information Compliance Team
Customer Service
Corporate Governance
Aberdeen City Council
3rd Floor North
Business Hub 17
Marischal College
Broad Street
ABERDEEN AB10 1AQ

foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk 

Tel 03000 200 292
 
*03000 numbers are free to call if you have ‘free minutes’ included in your mobile call plan.
Calls from BT landlines will be charged at the local call rate of  10.24p per minute (the same as 01224s).

www.aberdeencity.gov.uk
 




