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ocor I

Thank you for your information request of 13 December 2017. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

I request the following information regarding the utilisation of Cairncry Community Centre.

It is understood that the Centre is generally open between 9am and 10pm with occasional
weekend opening and that the following activities are undertaken at the Centre: namely

e Swedish Exercise

e Line Dancing

e Over 50's club

¢ Flash Dance

e Pilates

e Zumba / Zumba Gold

e Bowling / Short mat bowling

o Swedish Keep Fit

Please provide the days and times that the above activities utilise the Community Centre.
ACC does not hold this information as Cairncry Community Centre is not operated by ACC. It is
leased to an independent third party, Cairncry Community Centre Association and the
Management Committee of this Association are responsible for the activities which take place.
If you would like to contact the Cairncry Community Centre Association for this information, the
details are:

Elaine Kidd, Manager, Cairncry Community Centre Association, Cairncry Community Centre,
Foresterhill Road, Cornhill, Aberdeen AB16 5HL. Tel: 01224 698920. Email Cairncry@tiscali.co.uk

ACC has been provided with a copy of the programme of activities within Cairncry Community
Centre and this is attached (FOI-17-1907 — Cairncry 6 Monthly Programme 1 Spring 2017).

If you would like more detail about how community centres are operated within Aberdeen City
and the nature of the relationship between the tenants of the Community Centre and the
Council, the Community Centre Liaison Officer would be happy to help:
amulvie@aberdeencity.gov.uk and 01224 611158.

ACC is unable to provide you with the days and times that the above activities utilise the
Community Centre as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the
terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

Please provide details of any additional activities undertaken on a regular basis within the
Community Centre.
ACC has no information relating to this. Please refer to the above response.



ACC is unable to provide you with details of any additional activities undertaken on a regular
basis within the Community Centre as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its
obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this
information is not held by it.

Please provide an accurate estimate of the maximum number of people that each activity
usually attracts including instructors or other staff members.
ACC has no information relating to this. Please refer to the above response.

ACC is unable to provide you with an accurate estimate of the maximum number of people
that each activity usually attracts including instructors or other staff members as it is not held
by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC
hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

Please also confirm whether over the past five years the utilisation of the Community Centre
has remained approximately the same, diminished or increased.
ACC has no information relating to this. Please refer to the above response.

ACC is unable to provide you with whether over the past five years the utilisation of the
Community Centre has remained approximately the same, diminished or increased as it is not
held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA,
ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

If the utilisation of the centre has diminished or increased over the past five years please
provide an approximate % increase or decrease on an annualised basis.
ACC has no information relating to this. Please refer to the above response.

ACC is unable to provide you with an approximate % increase or decrease on an annualised
basis as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Section
17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it.

Finally, please advise what capital expenditure works have been identified to improve the
centre over the next five year period.

No capital works have been identified to improve the centre over the next five year period.
We hope this helps with your request.

Yours sincerely,

Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer

INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST
ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of

Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
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Wednesday

Activity

Creative Play (Term Time Only)
Bowling (short mat)
Flashdance Acro Classes
Swedish Keep Fit

Pilates

Parent & Toddlers

Parent & Toddlers

Kidz Club

Soo Yang Do (several grades)
Puppy School

CAIRNCRY COMMUNITY CENTRE
PROGRAMME OF ACTIVITIES

Place

Hall
Hall
Hall
Hall
Hall

Hall
Hall
Coffee Bar/GP Rm/Hall
Hall
Hall

Email: cairncry@tiscali.co.uk - Tel: 698920

Also 'like' us on Facebook to get regular updates

Updated 12th June 2017

SPRING 2017

Time

0945-11.15
13.30-15.45
1600-1800
18.30-19.30
19.30-20.30

09.30-11.30
12.30-14.30
15.30-17.30
17.30-19.30

1945-2045

Thursday

Friday

Parent & Toddlers
Toddler Flashdance
Bingo

Flashdance

Hall/Coffee Bar
Hall

Coffee Bar/GP Room

Hall

(various classes/age groups, see notice board for details)

Weight Watchers

Friday Café

Football Coaching Age 2-3 yrs
Football Coaching Age 3-5 yrs
Fortnightly Disco P1-7
Bowling (short mat)

Coffe Bar/GP Room

Coffee Bar
Hall
Hall
Hall
Hall

09.30-11.30
13.50-14.20
14.00-16.00
16.00-1930

1800-2000

0900-1100
1115-1200
1215-1300
1530-1715
1900-2130

Church of Scotland - Stockethill Community Church

1030-1200



D s

Street Dat

Bowling ( Hall 3.30-16.00
Parent & THall/Coffe 12.30-14.30

Puppy SctHall ~ [700-1800

Bowling (.Hall 9.00-11.30

Scottish SIGP Room [615-170(






Weight W GP Room/8.30-20.00

Hall 545-16.45

Dolphin Swimmingl 7:30-1930

Senior Ste Hall 1000-1100
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