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Thank you for your information request of 21 November 2017. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

Could I please be provided with:

1. A spreadsheet of details of all contracts between your local authority and Emmaus UK or
any of its individual branches in your area that were signed after 6 April 2013. Those details
should include:

a. Date contract signed

b. Total value of contract

c. Summary of services rendered by contract

ACC does not hold this information. Officers have undertaken a search of the BOrganised, e-
financials and the Social Care contracts systems and there are no records for Emmaus UK.

2. A copy of each of the contracts included in point 1.
Please refer to the response to Question 1 above.

ACC is unable to provide you with information on details of all contracts between ACC and
Emmaus UK or any of its individual branches in the area which were signed after 6 April 2013
or a copy of each contract as it is not held by ACC. In order to comply with its obligations under
the terms of Section 17 of the FOISA, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held
by it.

We hope this helps with your request.
Yours sincerely,

Anna Buchan
Information Compliance Officer

INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST

ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
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