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Thank you for your information request of 3 July 2017. Aberdeen City Council (ACC) has
completed the necessary search for the information requested.

1. The total monetary value associated with penalty charge notices attributed to the Bedford
Road bus gate site from the start of March 2017, to present, or as close to -- i.e end of June if
figures for July are unavailable.

Payment Amount
Iss. March 2017 £43,200.00
Iss. April 2017 £27,810.00
Iss. May 2017 £26,670.00
Iss. June 2017 £18,060.00
Total £115,740.00

2. Please break that amount down by the number of penalty charge notices issued and the
date issued.
Please refer to the attached spreadsheet, FOI-17-0961 — Breakdown.

3. Also provide a breakdown of the number of unique motorists receiving penalty charge
notices from that site.

ACC is unable to provide you with information on a breakdown of the number of unique
motorists receiving penalty charge notices from that site as it is not held by the Council. In
order to comply with its obligations under the terms of Regulation 10(4)(a) — Information Not
Held — of the EIRs, ACC hereby gives notice that this information is not held by it. ACC is required
by Regulation 10(1)(b) of the EIRs to inform you as to why in all the circumstances of the case,
the public interest in maintaining this exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing this
information to you. ACC is satisfied that it does not hold this information and considers that, as
there is no information held, the public interest lies with the exception.

4. Over the same period what was the total number of penalty charge notices issued at all
camera sites across the city please also provide the monetary value total and total number of
motorists to which penalty notices were issued.

Please refer to the attached spreadsheet, FOI-17-0961 — Stats by Camera.

We hope this helps with your request.

Yours sincerely,

Information Compliance Team



INFORMATION ABOUT THE HANDLING OF YOUR REQUEST

ACC handled your request for information in accordance with the provisions of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Please refer to the attached PDF for more information about
your rights under FOISA.
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We wish to advise you that the information which was released with this response is too large to be
uploaded to our disclosure log. If you are interested in viewing the attachment, please contact us at
foienquiries@aberdeencity.gov.uk, quoting the appropriate reference number, and we will provide

you with a copy.





