Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 (EIRs)
Refusal Notice Criteria Checklist 2012

Regulation 10(4)(a): Information Not Held
Notice that information is not held: where a Scottish public authority does not hold that information, it must, within the time allowed by regulation 5(2)(a) for complying with the request, give the applicant notice in writing that it does not hold it.
ACC is committed to openness and transparency.  Any decision made by your Service to exempt information must be clearly explained and robustly evidenced. The following criteria must be used by your Service to support the decision to apply an Information Not Held notice and/or confirm that no other information is held by ACC other than that already identified.

Please confirm that your Service does not hold the information by completing the following section:
1. Please provide the job title of the officer(s) who undertook the search for the information and/or confirmed that the information is not held by Aberdeen City Council:

Job title:

Service:

Directorate:

2. Please list the job title of any officers who were consulted as part of the search and why they were considered relevant:

Job title:

Reason for consulting these officers:

If the information is not held by your Service, but is / may be held by another area of ACC, please detail which Directorate and Service holds / may hold this information:
As the applicant considers that ACC holds the information, please explain why this is not the case by completing the following section:

3. Please explain why information is not held: (see guidance section)
4. Please explain whether ACC is required to hold the information for any legislative, business and/ or best practice reasons.  Please provide details.

5. Was the information held by ACC at the time the request was received?

a) When was the information created/ received by ACC?

b) Is the information held on behalf of another person?

6. Please list the types of files searched:

7. With respect to electronic searches, please list any search terms that were used:

8. If any search was not thought to be necessary, please explain why.
Guidance Notes
For ‘Information Not Held’ to be applied, the Commissioner must be satisfied that ACC has taken adequate steps to identify and locate all information relevant to a request.  In such cases, a simple assertion by ACC that the information is not held will not be sufficient: generally, the Commissioner will expect to be provided with compelling reasons if ACC has concluded that searches were unnecessary.

Adequate Steps:

ACC must be in a position to describe the searches it has carried out, and if appropriate, demonstrate that those searches have taken place.  The Commissioner will expect ACC to explain why the officer was the most appropriate person to undertake the search, that the requested information was not held at the time of receiving the request and/or that ACC has no obligation to hold or report on the requested information.
Reasons why information is not held
These may include:

ACC does not deliver that particular service

ACC does not hold the information in the way the applicant expects us to hold it

The information has been destroyed in accordance with ACC’s records retention schedule

There is no obligation to record, hold or report on the information

Does ACC hold the information under the terms of the EIRs?

The Information Not Held notice under the EIRs is different to the notice under FOISA.  Under FOISA, information is held by ACC if it is held by it otherwise than on behalf of another person.  However, under the EIRs, information is held by ACC irrespective of the source, author, owner or whether/how ACC makes use of the information.
ACC holds information if it is:

a) In its possession and has been produced or received by ACC or

b) Held by another person on ACC’s behalf.

For example, information held by ACC on its own behalf; information held by ACC on behalf of others; and information held by others on behalf of ACC.

Under the EIRs (Regulation 2(2)), ACC does not hold information which is held in confidence having been supplied by a UK Minister or government department.  Please contact the Access to Information Compliance (ATIC) Team for further advice on this.
Is ACC satisfied that sufficient reasoning has been provided to explain why ACC does not hold the information?

Regulation 10(4)(a) is subject to the public interest test, although OSIC recognise that where ACC can provide sufficient reasoning to satisfy the Commissioner that it does not in fact hold the information in question, the application of the public interest test would appear to be unnecessary.
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